
 

 

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
DISTRICT OF MAINE 

 
 
In re: 
 
MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC 
RAILWAY, LTD. 
 

Debtor. 
 

 
 
Bk. No. 13-10670 
Chapter 11 
 

 
SECOND INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT 

OF EXPENSES FOR DEVELOPMENT SPECIALISTS, INC., AS FINANCIAL  
ADVISOR FOR THE TRUSTEE, ROBERT J. KEACH, FOR THE PERIOD 

FROM MAY 1, 2014 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2014  
 
Name of Applicant: Development Specialists, Inc.

Authorized to Provide Professional Services as: Financial Advisor to Robert J. Keach, the 
duly appointed Chapter 11 trustee of the 

bankruptcy estate of the Debtor

Petition Date: August 7, 2013 

Date of Retention: August 29, 2013, nunc pro tunc to 
August 21, 2013

Period for Which Compensation and  
Reimbursement is Sought: 

May 1, 2014 through and including 
September 30, 2014

Total Amount of Compensation sought as actual, 
reasonable and necessary: 

$344,375.00

Total Amount of Expenses sought as actual, 
reasonable and necessary: 

$30,197.44

Total Fees and Expenses Requested: $374,572.44*

This is a(n): ___ monthly  X  interim ___ final   application.  

                                                 
* On October 1, 2014, the Trustee filed the Motion Pursuant to Sections 327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code to 
Amend the Terms of Retention of Development Specialists, Inc., as Financial Advisor to the Trustee Nunc Pro Tunc 
to August 11, 2014 [Docket No. 1130] (the “Amended Retention Application”).  In the event the court enters an 
order approving the Amended Retention Application, $84,814.90 of the amount requested (consisting of $76,073.00 
in fees and $8,741.90 in expenses) will be reimbursed by Central Maine & Quebec Railway US, Inc. to the Debtor.  
See Amended Retention Application, ¶ 9.   
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Prior Fee Applications:  
 Requested Approved/Received 
Date 
Filed 

Period Covered Fees Expenses Fees Expenses 

5/12/14 August 21, 2013 
– April 30, 2014 

$670,237.00 $63,463.31 $670,237.00 $63,463.31

 
 
 

SUMMARY BY TIMEKEEPER OF SERVICES RENDERED  

NAME OF 
PROFESSIONAL 

PERSON 

HOURLY 
BILLING 
RATES 

TOTAL 
BILLED 
HOURS 

TOTAL 
COMPENSATION 

Fred Caruso $635.00 486.8 $309,118.00

Fred Caruso (Travel)  $317.50 68.8 $21,844.00

Matt Farnsworth $260.00 45.9 $11,934.00

Eric Sweitzer $435.00 3.4 $1,479.00

Non-Billed Travel $0.00 41.3 $0.00

TOTAL 
 

646.2 $344,375.00

 
Blended professional hourly rate: $532.92 
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COMPENSATION BY FEE CATEGORY FOR SERVICES  
 

FEE CATEGORY HOURS AMOUNT 

Fee Application and Client Billing 5.1 $3,238.50

Court Hearings 5.5 $3,492.50

Business Analysis 130.9 $82,104.00

Monthly Operating Reports 40.5 $11,580.00

Claims Analysis 6.7 $1,742.00

Managing Business 86.8 $55,118.00

Sale Process 68.9 $43,526.50

Secured Financing 20.6 $13,081.00

Travel  68.8 $21,844.00

Transition Services 171.1 $108,648.50

Non-Billed Travel 41.3 $0.00

TOTAL 646.2 $344,375.00

 
 

EXPENSE SUMMARY FOR SERVICES RENDERED  
 

CHARGES & DISBURSEMENTS AMOUNTS 
Airfare $15,846.88 

Lodging $6,231.80 

Meals $1,888.24 

Rental Care $3,336.15 

Parking, etc.  $2,451.53 

Long Distance Telephone $155.01 

Photocopy $127.80 

Miscellaneous Supplies (Hard Drive for Electronic File 
Retention) 

$120.00 

Overnight Delivery $40.03 

TOTAL $30,197.44
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 

DISTRICT OF MAINE 
 
 
In re: 
 
MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC 
RAILWAY, LTD. 
 

Debtor. 
 

 
 
Bk. No. 13-10670 
Chapter 11 
 

 
SECOND INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT 

OF EXPENSES FOR DEVELOPMENT SPECIALISTS, INC., AS FINANCIAL  
ADVISOR FOR THE TRUSTEE, ROBERT J. KEACH, FOR THE PERIOD 

FROM MAY 1, 2014 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2014  
 

Development Specialists Inc. (“DSI”), financial advisor to Robert J. Keach, the duly 

appointed chapter 11 trustee (the “Trustee”) in the above-captioned chapter 11 case of Montreal 

Maine & Atlantic Railway, Ltd. (the “Debtor”), submits this second interim application (the “Fee 

Application”) for compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses for the 

period from May 1, 2014 through and including September 30, 2014 (the “Compensation 

Period”).  In support of the Fee Application, DSI states as follows: 

JURISDICTION AND VENUE 

1. This Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 

1334.  Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.  This matter is a core 

proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §157(b)(2).  The statutory predicates for the relief sought 

herein are sections 327(a) and 330 of the Bankruptcy Code (defined below), Federal Rule of 

Bankruptcy Procedure 2016(a), and Rule 2016-1 of the local rules of this Court (the “Local 

Rules”). 
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BACKGROUND 

2. On August 7, 2013 (the “Petition Date”), the Debtor filed a voluntary petition for 

relief under chapter 11 of 11 U.S.C. § 101 et seq. (the “Bankruptcy Code”), in the United States 

Bankruptcy Court for the District of Maine (the “Bankruptcy Court”).  On August 21, 2013, the 

United States Trustee (the “U.S. Trustee”) appointed the Trustee to serve in the Debtor’s chapter 

11 case (the “Case”) pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 1163. 

3. On August 26, 2013, the Trustee filed his Application for Order, Pursuant to 

Sections 327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code, Authorizing the Employment of Development 

Specialists Inc., as Financial Advisor for the Trustee Nunc Pro Tunc to August 21, 2013 [Docket 

No. 100] (the “Retention Application”).  Thereafter, on August 29, 2013, the Court entered an 

order authorizing the employment of DSI as financial advisor to the Trustee pursuant to sections 

327 and 328 of the Bankruptcy Code [Docket No. 119] (the “Retention Order”).   

4. As set forth in the Retention Order, DSI is authorized to, inter alia: 

(a) Analyze and comment on operating and cash flow projections, 
operating results, financial statements, other documents and 
information provided by the Debtor, and other data pursuant to the 
Trustee’s request;  
 

(b) Advise and assist the Trustee in reviewing the Debtor’s supporting 
information relating to any historical financial information, financial 
projections and underlying assumptions; 
 

(c) Advise and assist the Trustee with respect to evaluation of whether 
liabilities are pre-or post-petition; 
 

(d) Advise the Trustee in connection with the Debtor’s preparation of 
various financial reports for submission to the Court, including monthly 
operating reports, schedules of assets and liabilities, and statements of 
financial affairs for the Debtor; 
 

(e) Assist the Trustee with preparation of information for both the 
disclosure statement and plan of reorganization, including estimation of 
various recovery values by claims class; 
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(f) Provide testimony on related matters, as appropriate; and 

 
(g) Provide any other reasonably related financial advisory or 

management consulting services that the Trustee may, from time to 
time, request. 
 

See Retention Order, ¶ 4.   

5. The Retention Order further provides that DSI shall receive compensation on an 

hourly basis and in accordance with the applicable provisions of the Bankruptcy Code, the 

Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, the Local Rules, the United States Trustee Guidelines 

for Reviewing Applications for Compensation & Reimbursement of Expenses filed under 11 

U.S.C. § 330 (the “UST Guidelines”), and any applicable orders of the Court.  See Retention 

Order, ¶¶ 1–2; see also Retention Application, ¶¶ 15–16.   

6. On October 1, 2014, the Trustee filed the Motion Pursuant to Sections 327 and 

328 of the Bankruptcy Code to Amend the Terms of Retention of Development Specialists, Inc., 

as Financial Advisor to the Trustee Nunc Pro Tunc to August 11, 2014 [Docket No. 1130] (the 

“Amended Retention Application”).  The Amended Retention Application seeks to expand the 

scope of DSI’s retention to include DSI to provide certain services to Central Maine & Quebec 

Railway US, Inc. (“CMQ”).  See Amended Retention Application, ¶ 9.  For these services, CMQ 

shall remit payment to the Debtor and the Debtor shall use payment received “to pay the 

associated fees and expenses requested by DSI in an interim or final application for 

compensation and reimbursement to the extent approved the Bankruptcy Court . . . .”  Id.   

7. Since entry of the Retention Order, and throughout the Compensation Period, DSI 

has worked with the Trustee to meet the extraordinary challenges presented by this Case in a 

manner beneficial to the Debtor and the creditors of the Debtor’s estate.  The following 
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discussion and materials annexed hereto cover the major categories of services for which 

allowance of compensation is sought. 

COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT REQUEST 

8. DSI seeks allowance of compensation for professional services in the amount of 

$344,375.00 and reimbursement of expenses incurred in rendering such services in the amount of 

$30,197.44.  Pursuant to Rule 2016(a) of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and Local 

Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(i), a detailed statement of professional services provided by DSI to the Trustee 

(the “Billing Statement”) is set forth in Exhibit A, annexed hereto and incorporated herein by 

reference.  DSI has carefully reviewed the Billing Statement on a line-by-line basis to ensure that 

services have been billed under the correct fee category.1 

9. Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(iv), a detailed statement setting forth billing 

rates, total hours billed, and total amounts billed for each professional at DSI during the 

Compensation Period and associated expenses incurred is contained in the tables located at the 

beginning of this Fee Application.  

10. No agreement or understanding exists between DSI and any other entity for the 

sharing of compensation sought by this Fee Application.  In addition, no payments have been 

made or promised to DSI for services rendered or to be rendered in connection with the Case, 

except as set forth in the Retention Application.   

11. As discussed in the Retention Application and the Affidavit of M. Donald 

Gardner, Jr. in Support of First Day Pleadings [Docket No. 11] (the “Gardner Affidavit”), DSI is 

one of the nation’s oldest and most respected financial restructuring, consulting and management 

firms, and routinely operates, manages, and consults “troubled businesses” on behalf of lending 

                                                 
1 DSI implemented ten (10) task codes for specific categories of work to permit a more detailed analysis of the fees 
incurred.  Given the large range of issues involved, some overlaps and inconsistences in task code assignments are 
inevitable despite DSI’s best efforts to ensure that work on a specific topic is billed to a single task code 
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institutions as well as other secured parties, bondholders, shareholder committees, court-

approved fiduciaries, and business owners.  DSI is experienced in all aspects of insolvency and 

bankruptcy consulting, and regularly serves as consultant to debtors in both Chapter 7 and 

Chapter 11 proceedings, as well as in other fiduciary capacities such as Chapter 11 Trustee, 

Chapter 7 Trustee, Court-Appointed Examiner, Post-Confirmation Trustee, Federal Equity and 

state court receiverships.  Consultants from DSI have been involved in over 4,000 cases 

throughout the United States, Puerto Rico, the Virgin Islands, Canada and Europe.  DSI has the 

necessary background to deal effectively with the financial issues and problems that have arisen 

and may arise in the context of the Case and has rendered financial advice to the Trustee in an 

efficient and timely manner.  Pursuant to Local Rule 2016-1(a)(3)(v), a brief biography of each 

DSI professional who has rendered services in connection with the fees and expenses herein is 

set forth in Exhibit B, annexed hereto and incorporated herein by reference. 

12. This Fee Application is DSI’s second interim application to this Court for 

compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses pursuant to sections 328 

and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure, and 

Local Rule 2016-1.2  As required by paragraph (b)(v) of the UST Guidelines, the Trustee has 

been given the opportunity to review this Fee Application and has approved the requested 

amount.   

SUMMARY OF SERVICES 

13. DSI serves as financial advisor to the Trustee with respect to all financial matters 

that arise in or relate to this Case.  In rendering professional services to the Trustee, DSI’s team 

                                                 
2 On May 12, 2014, DSI submitted the First Interim Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses 
for Development Specialist, Inc., as Financial Advisor to the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from August 
21, 2013 Through April 30, 2014 [Docket No. 872] (the “First Fee Application”).  On June 11, 2014, this Court 
awarded DSI fees in the amount of $670,237.00 and expenses in the amount of $63,463.31 with respect to the First 
Fee Application.    
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includes professionals with extensive experience in financial analysis related to bankruptcy, asset 

sales and valuation, secured financing, and management (among other things).  DSI 

professionals have worked closely with the Trustee and his other professionals to coordinate 

assignments in order to maximize efficiency and avoid any duplication of effort. 

14. DSI does not wish to burden the Court with an overly detailed recitation of each 

and every matter with respect to which it has rendered services during the Compensation Period 

(all of which are detailed more fully in the Billing Statements).  Accordingly, this Fee 

Application is intended to serve as a summary description of the more significant services 

rendered by DSI, and to highlight the benefits which have been conferred upon the creditors of 

the Debtor’s estate as a result of DSI’s efforts.  The following section provides an overview of 

certain of the significant services rendered by DSI during the Compensation Period, organized by 

task code.   

15. All of the services for which DSI requests compensation herein were rendered on 

behalf of the Trustee in connection with this Case, and all the time described on the attached 

exhibits represents the actual amount of time spent by DSI professionals who rendered the 

described services.  The major services provided by DSI (by category) are summarized below: 

(a) Fees and Billing: Total $3,238.50; Total Hours 5.1 
 

i. Monthly review of consultants’ detailed time entries for accuracy and 
efficiency, approve monthly invoice issued to the Trustee and prepare the 
First Fee Application. 
 

(b) Court Hearings: Total $3,492.50; Total Hours 5.5 
 

i. Attend court hearings as a potential witness regarding cash collateral 
issues and attend hearing relating to the First Fee Application. 
 

(c) Business Analysis: Total $82,104.00; Total Hours 130.9 
 

i. Monitor daily cash flow and approve weekly disbursements. 
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ii. Monitor accounts receivable for collectability enforcement. 
iii. Prepare cash flow forecasts for use by Trustee and the Canadian monitor. 
iv. Prepare weekly collateral reporting for the Wheeling and Lake Erie 

Railway Co. (“Wheeling”) revolver loan. 
v. Analyze and monitor the Interline Settlement System and Car Hire 

Revenue reporting systems to better forecast freight revenue and cash 
receipts. 

vi. Prepare and respond to information requests from the Canadian monitor. 
vii. Assist in the preparation of monthly financial statements. 

viii. Oversee posting May 15, 2014 funding of Derby operation and 
reimbursement from CMQ. 

ix. Analyze cash receipt and disbursement allocation issues between the 
Debtor and CMQ as a result of the US and Canadian asset sales on May 
15, 2014 and June 30, 2014, respectively. 
 

(d) Monthly Operating Reports: Total $11,580.00; Total Hours 40.5 
 

i. Prepare the Debtor’s monthly operating reports, including review of the 
Debtor’s six operating accounts; reconciliation of three accounts 
receivable ledgers and two accounts payable ledgers.  
 

(e) Claims Analysis: Total $1,742.00; Total Hours 6.7 
 

i. Time for this category primarily includes the process to extract 
disbursement activity from the Debtor’s accounting records and create a 
database for further claims analysis.3   
 

(f) Managing Business: Total $55,118.00; Total Hours 86.8 
 

i. Attend the Debtor’s daily meetings, in person or by phone, to monitor 
business operations in order to be kept informed of issues that could 
impair the Debtor’s cash flow or require special handling due to the Case. 

ii. Assist management in dealing with third party trade accounts payable 
issues caused by the Case. 

iii. Assist human resources management in resolving personnel issues, 
including retention, health insurance and training issues. 

iv. Assist management in third party contract issues for land occupation 
agreements and for ordinary course operations issues. 

v. Oversee operational transition issues between the Debtor and CMQ for 
both the US and Canadian sales.  

vi. Oversee the return of equipment for lease contracts not assumed by the 
buyer or termination of contractual issues for other miscellaneous 
contracts not assumed. 

vii. Plan and oversee the retention of both paper and electronic information. 

                                                 
3 DSI did not invoice for hours incurred by a summer intern that worked on this task.   
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viii. Review general liability and insurance policies for the Derby operation 
and the Canadian operations through June 30, 2014.   
 

(g) Sale Process: Total $43,526.50; Total Hours 68.9 
 

i. Assist the Trustee in reviewing proposed asset purchase contracts for both 
operational and financial issues.  

ii. Prepare supporting schedules and exhibits for the US and Canadian asset 
purchase contracts.  

iii. Plan for and address the additional complexities created by the bifurcation 
of the US and Canadian asset sales.  

iv. Coordinate with Bangor Savings Bank for the auction of 25 locomotives.  
 

(h) Secured Financing: Total $13,081.00; Total Hours 20.6 
 

i. Preparation of various information schedules regarding Wheeling 
collateral and in defense of Wheeling’s alleged administrative claims. 
 

(i) Non-working Travel: Total $21,844.00; Total Hours 68.8 (41.3 hours not 
billed) 
 

i. Travel from Chicago to the Debtor’s headquarters in Hermon, Maine.4  
 

(j) Transition Services: Total $108,648.50; Total Hours 171.10 
 

i. Pursuant to the court-approved transition services agreement between the 
Debtor and CMQ, DSI was to provide transition services (primarily 
accounting and “institutional” knowledge) to CMQ, and the accounting 
department, now paid by CMQ, would continue to provide general ledger 
accounting services. This arrangement continued through July 30, 2014.   

ii. In early August, it became apparent that CMQ would require continued 
assistance from DSI that was more than originally contemplated, and the 
Debtor filed a motion to amend the transition services agreement in 
September. Per the attached invoices to CMQ, total reimbursement for 
services rendered by DSI for August and September totaled $41,402.00 
($45,593.00 including travel) and $28,384.50 ($30,480.00 including 
travel), respectively.  See Amended Retention Application, Exhibit A.  
Invoices for these services are set forth in Exhibit C.   

 
 

                                                 
4 As in the First Fee Application, DSI did not invoice for travel time for flights between Chicago and Portland, and 
invoiced the Debtor 2.20 hours for the drive time between Portland and Herman, Maine which was charged at one-
half rate. When direct flights between Chicago and Bangor became available in June, DSI continued to limit total 
one-way travel time invoiced to 2.20 hours, no matter how much additional time was incurred due to flight delays.  
Of the total $21,844.00 requested for this category, $6,286.50 is reimbursable by CMQ pursuant to the amended 
servicing contract (see narrative for the Transition Services category for further information).  
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ACTUAL AND NECESSARY DISBURSEMENTS 

16. As set forth on Exhibit A attached hereto, DSI has disbursed $30,197.44 as 

expenses incurred in providing professional services during the Compensation Period.  The 

expenses incurred arise from, inter alia, meals, photocopies, overnight delivery charges, travel 

expenses and accommodations, miscellaneous expenses, and long-distance telephone charges.  

These expenses represent the out-of-pocket disbursements incurred during the regular course of 

the provision of services. 

THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION SHOULD BE ALLOWED 
 

17. Pursuant to section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Court may award 

professionals “reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services.”  11 U.S.C. 

§ 330(a)(1)(A). The Court may, on its own motion or an objection filed by a party in interest, 

“award compensation that is less than the amount of compensation that is requested.”  11 U.S.C. 

§ 330(a)(2). In evaluating the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the Court 

should consider: 

the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant 
factors including: 

 
(A) the time spent on such services; 
 
(B) the rates charged for such services; 
 
(C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or 
beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the 
completion of, a case under this title; 
 
(D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of 
time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the 
problem, issue, or task addressed; 
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(E) with respect to a professional person, whether the person is board 
certified or otherwise has demonstrated skill and experience in the 
bankruptcy field; and 
 
(F) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary 
compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other 
than cases under this title. 

 
18. DSI submits that the services for which it seeks compensation in this Fee 

Application were necessary for and beneficial to the Debtor’s estate.  The services rendered by 

DSI were performed economically, effectively, and efficiently.  Accordingly, the compensation 

requested herein is reasonable in light of the nature, extent, and value of such services to the 

Debtor.   

19. The work conducted was carefully assigned to appropriate professionals 

according the experience and level of expertise required for each particular task.  Whenever 

possible and where appropriate, DSI sought to minimize the costs of its services by utilizing 

talented professionals with lower billing rates.   

20. In sum, the services rendered by DSI were necessary and beneficial to the Debtor 

and such services were consistently performed in a timely manner, commensurate with the 

complexity and nature of the issues involved.  Accordingly, approval of compensation sought 

herein is warranted.   

 

 

 

 

 

 

Case 13-10670    Doc 1168    Filed 10/24/14    Entered 10/24/14 13:54:30    Desc Main
 Document      Page 13 of 14



Case 13-10670    Doc 1168    Filed 10/24/14    Entered 10/24/14 13:54:30    Desc Main
 Document      Page 14 of 14



 

1 
 

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
DISTRICT OF MAINE 

 
 
In re: 
 
MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC 
RAILWAY, LTD. 
 

Debtor. 
 

 
 
Bk. No. 13-10670 
Chapter 11 
 

 
ORDER GRANTING SECOND INTERIM APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION 
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR DEVELOPMENT SPECIALISTS, 

INC., AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR FOR THE TRUSTEE, ROBERT J. KEACH, FOR 
THE PERIOD FROM MAY 1, 2014 THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2014 

 
 This matter having come before the Court on the Second Interim Application for 

Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses for Development Specialists, Inc., as Financial 

Adviser for the Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from May 1, 2014 Through September 

30, 2014 (the “Fee Application”), and after proper notice to all creditors and other parties-in-

interest, the Court having independently reviewed the Fee Application, it is hereby 

ORDERED, ADJUDGED, and DECREED as follows: 

1. The Fee Application is granted. 

2. In relation to the Application Period (as defined in the Fee Application) and 

pursuant to 11 U.S.C. § 331, Development Specialists, Inc. (“DSI”) is allowed compensation 

for services to Robert J. Keach, Esq., the chapter 11 trustee, in the aggregate amount of 

$374,572.44, including professional fees in the amount of $344,375.00 and reimbursement of 

expenses in the amount of $30,197.44.   
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3. The fees and expenses for the Application Period are hereby awarded on an 

interim basis in accordance with the applicable sections of the Bankruptcy Code, the Federal Rules 

of Bankruptcy Procedure, and this Court’s local rules. 

 

 

Dated: ___________, 2014   

      ______________________________________ 
      The Honorable Louis H. Kornreich 

United States Bankruptcy Court for the District of 
Maine 
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
DISTRICT OF MAINE 

 
 
In re: 
 
MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC 
RAILWAY, LTD. 
 

Debtor. 
 

 
 
Bk. No. 13-10670 
Chapter 11 
 

 
 

NOTICE OF HEARING 
 

 Development Specialists, Inc. (“DSI”), the financial adviser to Robert J. Keach, the 
chapter 11 trustee, has filed the Second Interim Application for Compensation and 
Reimbursement of Expenses for Development Specialists, Inc., as Financial Adviser for the 
Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from May 1, 2014 Through September 30, 2014 (the 
“Application”).  A hearing on the Application is set to take place at the United States 
Bankruptcy Court, 202 Harlow Street, 3rd Floor, Bangor, Maine on November 18 at 10:00 
a.m. (the “Hearing”).   
 
 By the Application, DSI seeks a total amount of $374,572.44, which includes 
$344,375.00 for payment of professional fees and $30,197.44 for reimbursement of expenses 
incurred during the period from May 1, 2014 through September 30, 2014 (the “Compensation 
Period”).  DSI seeks an order authorizing and approving this compensation for the fees and 
expenses incurred during the Compensation Period on an interim basis.  The Application is the 
second interim fee application filed by DSI.   
 
 On May 12, 2014, DSI filed the First Interim Application for Compensation and 
Reimbursement of Expenses for Development Specialist, Inc., as Financial Advisor to the 
Trustee, Robert J. Keach, for the Period from August 21, 2013 Through April 30, 2014 [Docket 
No. 872] (the “First Fee Application”).  With respect to the First Fee Application which covered 
the period of August 21, 2013 through April 30, 2014, the Court awarded DSI fees in the 
amount of $670,237.00 and expenses in the amount of $63,463.31.    
 
 Your rights may be affected.  You should read these papers carefully and discuss 
them with your attorney, if you have one in this bankruptcy case.  If you do not have an 
attorney, you may wish to consult one. 
 
 If you do not want the court to approve the Application, or if you want the court to 
consider your views on the Application, then on or before November 10, 2014, you or your 
attorney must file with the court a written response explaining your position.  If you are not able 
to access the CM/ECF Filing System, your response should be served upon the Court at: 
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Alec Leddy, Clerk 
United States Bankruptcy Court 

202 Harlow Street 
Bangor, Maine 04401 

 
-and- 

 
Robert J. Keach, Esq. 

Bernstein, Shur, Sawyer & Nelson, P.A. 
100 Middle St., PO Box 9729 
Portland, Maine 04104-5029 

 
 If you have to mail your response to the Court for filing, you must mail it early enough 
so that the Court will receive it on or before the date stated above. 
 
 If you or your attorney do not take these steps, the Court may decide that you do not 
oppose the relief sought in the Application and may enter an order granting that relief. 
 
 
Dated:  October 24, 2014  ROBERT J. KEACH, CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE OF  

MONTREAL MAINE & ATLANTIC RAILWAY, LTD.
  

By his attorneys: 
 

/s Sam Anderson    
D. Sam Anderson, Esq. 
Michael A. Fagone, Esq. 
BERNSTEIN, SHUR, SAWYER & NELSON, P.A. 
100 Middle Street 
P.O. Box 9729 
Portland, ME 04104 
Telephone: (207) 774-1200 
Facsimile: (207) 774-1127 
E-mail: sanderson@bernsteinshur.com 
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No. 10761


REMIT TO:


Telephone: 312.263.4141 Telecopier: 312.263.1180


Date: 10/08/14


Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Railway
c/o Robert J.  Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland, Maine  04104


F.E.I.N. 36-2967476


Fees Disbursements Credits Balance


For professional services rendered from May 01, 2014 
  through September 30, 2014:


  Fee Application/Client Billing $3,238.50
  Attend Court Hearings/Review Pleadings 3,492.50
  Business Analysis 82,104.00
  Preparation of Monthly Operating Reports 11,580.00
  Claims Analysis 1,742.00
  Managing Business Operations 55,118.00
  Sale Process 43,526.50
  Secured Lender 13,081.00
  Travel (at 1/2 rate) 21,844.00
  Transition Services 108,648.50
      Total Fees $344,375.00


Administrative Costs:
  Airfare $15,846.88
  Lodging 6,231.80
  Meals 1,888.24
  Car Rental 3,336.15
  Parking/Tolls/Cabs/Mileage 2,451.53
  Messenger/Overnight Services 40.03
  Photocopies 127.80
  Long Distance Calls 155.01
  Miscellaneous Charges (hard drive, jump drive) 120.00
       Total Expenses $30,197.44
       Total Fees and Expenses $374,572.44


Amount reimburseable from Fortress for August 2014: ($45,593.00) ($6,728.33) ($52,321.33)


Amount reimburseable from Fortress for September 2014: ($30,480.00) ($2,013.57) ($32,493.57)


Net Due $289,757.54


PAY LAST AMOUNT
TIMELY PAYMENT OF INVOICES IS ALWAYS APPRECIATED. IN THIS COLUMN


Three First National Plaza     70 West Madison Street, Suite 2300, Chicago, IL 60602-4250


Description of Services and Disbursements
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/08/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
05/06/2014 FCC Review DSI's consultant time for April and expenses. 0.40


05/09/2014 FCC Prepare information for DSI's fee application from
inception through 4/30/14, including review of time
entries, expense summary and prepare narrative for
time categories. 1.80


05/12/2014 FCC Review, approve and execute motion and exhibits for
DSI's first fee application. 0.30


06/10/2014 FCC Review consultant detailed time entries for May. 0.40


07/11/2014 FCC Review detail time entries for June and expenses
incurred. 0.40


08/11/2014 FCC Review and approve time detail and expenses for
July. 0.40


09/24/2014 FCC Review consultants' detailed time entries for August
2014. 0.40


09/25/2014 FCC Begin preparation of DSI's second interim fee
application from April 2014 through September 2014. 1.00


Fee Application/Client Billing 5.10 3,238.50


05/08/2014 FCC At request of counsel, attend bankruptcy court
regarding Wheeling DIP motions, including attendance
at meeting with the judge in chambers after the
hearing. 3.50


06/11/2014 FCC Attend bankruptcy court hearing for fee application
and status hearing. 2.00


Attend Court Hrgs/Rev Pleadgs 5.50 3,492.50


05/01/2014 FCC Review and approve the cash disbursement for the
current week. 0.20


05/02/2014 TFC Attempt to tie out accounts payable detail to check
export file. 1.00 n/c


05/05/2014 FCC Prepare the Wheeling collateral report for the week
ended 5/2/14, including U.S. and Canadian accounts
receivable and accounts payable ledgers, U.S. and
Canadian ISS and Unsettled Waybill reports, cash
collections summary and spare part inventory report
and e-mail to Mike Fagone for distribution. 1.50


05/06/2014 ERS Review the financial system backup and
correspondence with T. Caruso regarding same. 2.00


FCC Review the budget-versus-actual results for the week
ended 5/2/14 and meeting with Jim Speed and Torrie
Potter regarding receipt allocation. 0.70
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HOURS
FCC Update the rollforward cash forecast through 5/16/14


for last week's results, prepare the revised
waterfall analysis and draft closing statement for
same, including meetings with Gaynor Ryan and Don
Gardner regarding benefit forecast and certain
operating expenses. 2.20


FCC Review the draft termination agreement with CIT and
e-mail comments to Sam Anderson. 0.30


05/07/2014 FCC Review accounts payable ledgers for U.S. and Canada
for disbursements for this week. 0.30


05/08/2014 FCC Review the draft profit and loss for April and
record comments for Jim Speed and Torrie Potter. 0.40


05/09/2014 FCC Update the cash planning based upon the activity
through today's check run, including review of
outstanding accounts payable for both U.S. and
Canada. 0.60


05/12/2014 FCC Begin preparation of collateral reports for the week
ending 5/9/14. 0.80


FCC Meeting with Kim Thompson regarding preparation of
the analysis of the waybills owed from and to
Canadian Pacific, review finished work product and
meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding same for
presentation on the settlement discussion with
Canadian Pacific for return of the two empty oil
trains. 1.60


FCC Review and approve $29,000 purchase order for
certain repair parts and receive approval from Ryan
Ratledge to add to the JCN schedule. 0.20


ERS Review of data backup performed by T. Caruso and
correspondence with T. Caruso and D. Houghton
regarding same. 1.40


05/13/2014 FCC Complete collateral report for the week ending
5/9/14 and e-mail same to Mike Fagone for
distribution. 0.90


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter regarding update of spare
parts inventory. 0.20


05/16/2014 FCC Review and approve additional request disbursements
for the day. 0.20


FCC Meeting with John (accounts payable clerk) regarding
tracking of disbursements requiring allocation
between the buyer and the seller. 0.30


FCC Prepare the first draft of the wind down budget
through 7/31/14, including estimation of ISS
outstanding as of 5/15/14 and collectibility of
remaining accounts receivable outstanding and timing
of same. 1.40


05/19/2014 FCC Prepare collateral report for the week ending
5/16/14, including review of U.S. and Canadian
accounts receivable reports, accounts payable
reports, Waybill and ISS reports, and spare parts
inventory; e-mail same to Mike Fagone for
distribution. 1.20


FCC Review cutoff issues for net freight revenue as of
5/15/14, including cars that were "spotted" on
5/15/14 that were not interchanged and meeting with
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HOURS
Jim Speed regarding same. 1.10


FCC Review the account statement for Old Town Fuel and
Fiber; e-mail the settlement information to Mike
Fagone. 0.30


FCC Review the budget-versus-actual results for the week
ending 5/16/14; meeting with Jim Speed regarding
questions and update the wind down budget for
accounts receivable and ISS balances as of 5/16/14,
and estimated wind down expenses for the U.S. and
continuing expenses for MCC. 1.20


FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding return of empty
oil train cars and follow-up meeting with Bob
Grindrod (.6); review and update the analysis of net
amounts owed by Canadian Pacific to MMA for prior
car loads (.4). 1.00


05/21/2014 FCC Review and analyze the car hire revenue, expense
issues and accounting records for a terminated
employee related to same. 2.50


FCC Update the wind down budget for receipts and
disbursements through today and review outstanding
accounts payable for payment approval for this week. 0.80


05/22/2014 FCC Continue review of outstanding unrecorded car hire
revenue and expense caused by departure of an
employee. 1.80


FCC Review status of USDA APHIS tax returns and meetings
with Bob Grindrod and Alison Jewel regarding same. 1.40


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter regarding review of past
due accounts receivable. 0.30


05/23/2014 FCC Review calculation of receivables to be factored
prepared by Jim Speed and request cash advance from
CMQ. 0.30


05/27/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson regarding current
funding mechanism and budget for the next 30 days. 0.30


FCC Prepare collateral report for the week ending
5/23/14, including review of U.S. and Canadian
accounts receivable ledgers, accounts payable
ledgers, ISS and Waybill reports; e-mail report to
Mike Fagone for distribution. 1.00


FCC Review cash and disbursement activity for the week
ended 5/23/14 and update the wind down budget for
U.S. and operations budget for Canada; telephone
call with Bob Keach regarding same. 1.20


FCC Respond to information request from Andrew Adessky
regarding U.S. closing and post-sale operations. 0.30


FCC Review sales cutoff issues for freight revenue and
e-mail Jim Speed regarding correction of invoice for
$10,000. 0.40


05/28/2014 FCC Review payroll funding request for Derby employees,
vacation and severance wages for employees not
retained by CMQ; telephone call with Gaynor Ryan
regarding same. 1.00


05/29/2014 FCC Telephone call with Torrie Potter regarding car hire
revenue and expense issues, accounts receivable
collection and write-off issues. 0.40


FCC Review e-mail from Torrie Potter regarding revenue
cutoff issues and telephone call with Torrie
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HOURS
regarding same. 0.30


FCC Review disbursement requests from John Fressenden
and telephone call with Don Gardner regarding cutoff
issues. 0.50


05/30/2014 FCC Telephone call with Jim Speed regarding status of
audit issues for 3/31/14 and 12/31/13. 0.30


FCC Review e-mail from Kyle Johnston regarding funding
mechanism for the Canadian operations and e-mail
budget and prior e-mails with Ken Nicholson
regarding same. 0.50


FCC Review and approve factoring computation for net
freight revenue for the 7 days ended 5/30/14 and
approve same; e-mail with John Fressenden confirming
receipt of same. 0.40


FCC Telephone call with Don Gardner regarding status of
car hire revenue and expense review and allocation
of revenue and expenses between U.S. and Canada. 0.50


FCC Multiple telephone calls and e-mail exchanges with
Peter Bleach regarding renewal of D&O and employment
practices policies and tail policy for each related
to expiring policy. 0.80


06/02/2014 FCC Review cash receipts and disbursements for the week
ending 5/30/14 and identify cutoff issues and
reconciliation of change in accounts receivable, and
update wind down budget for same. 1.60


06/03/2014 FCC Prepare Wheeling collateral report for the week
ending 5-30-14, including review of U.S. and Canada
accounts receivable and accounts payable, and U.S.
and Canada waybill activity; e-mail same to Mike
Fagone for distribution. 0.80


FCC Update the U.S. wind down budget and Canada
operational budget, including reconciliation and
review of shared and reimbursable expenses from the
CMQ. 0.90


FCC Review and approve disbursements for the D&O tail
policy, CIT locomotive rent and previously received
discovery-related costs. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding information
request (.1) and prepare summary of the closing
statement, escrow activity and additional amounts
paid by Fortress at closing; e-mail same to Bob
(.7). 0.80


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter, Jim Speed and Sachi
Mishra regarding general ledger closing procedures
for May, including extraction of information from
ISS for allocation freight and miscellaneous between
MMA and CMQ for post-closing period. 1.50


FCC Review the ISS payoff statement as of 6/2/14 for
allocation issues and review the U.S. and Canada
waybill reports to determine remaining ISS liability
outstanding. 0.80


06/04/2014 FCC Meeting with Sachi Mishra regarding the ISS
liability cutoff issues. 0.60


FCC Review car hire revenue receipt totaling $76,000 and
approve payment of car hire expense of $64,000 to
Midwest Railcar and Flex Leasing. 0.30


06/05/2014 FCC Review allocation entries made by Don Gardner and
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HOURS
Torrie Potter and create trial balance analysis for
same and preliminary schedule of additional required
entries. 1.80


FCC Prepare schedule of payables and receivables from
CMQ for post-sale allocation issues and operation of
Canada and meeting with Sachi Mishra regarding same. 1.00


FCC Review the general ledger account reconciliations
prepared by Torrie Potter and Jim Speed as of
12/31/13. 0.80


MEF Conversation with F. Caruso regarding MMA and MCC
trial balances, combine trial balances of both
entities into one spreadsheet and e-mail file to F.
Caruso. 0.90


06/09/2014 FCC Review receipt and disbursement activity for the
week ended 6/9/14 for the U.S. and Canada and update
wind down budgets for both. 1.10


FCC Telephone call with Don Gardner regarding additional
allocation journal entries required to complete the
2013 financial statements. 0.20


06/10/2014 FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter regarding cash receipts
cutoff issues and approve reimbursement to CMQ for
same. 0.40


FCC Prepare the Wheeling collateral report for the week
ended 6/6/14, including review of U.S. and Canadian
accounts receivable and accounts payable ledgers,
and ISS and Unsettled Waybill reports; e-mail same
to Mike Fagone for distribution. 0.80


FCC Meeting with Gaynor Ryan regarding status of all
benefit payments for both the U.S. and Canada
employees. 0.30


FCC Review accounts receivable ledgers that are past due
and send e-mail requesting payment from a customer. 0.50


06/11/2014 FCC Meeting with Jim Speed and Torrie Potter regarding
accounting closing and allocation issues for May. 0.90


FCC E-mail exchange with Greg Sanborn regarding fixed
asset depreciation schedules and the ability to
identify assets between Maine and Vermont. 0.20


06/12/2014 FCC Review and approve payrolls for the Derby warehouse
operations and Canadian operations, prepare schedule
of reimbursement for Derby and other miscellaneous
transactions that have occurred through this week. 1.10


FCC Analyze the outstanding zone billing issues for the
CN and SLQ railroads (.4); meeting with Don Gardner
regarding same and instruct him to make collection
calls on these and several other accounts (.2). 0.60


06/13/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ellis regarding $60,000
past due accounts receivable collection. 0.10


FCC Telephone call with Bob Grindrod and Patrice Benoit
regarding proof of claim to be filed by MCC in the
MMA case; telephone call with Mike Fagone regarding
same. 0.30


06/16/2014 FCC Prepare collateral report for the week ended
6-13-14, including review of the U.S. and Canada
accounts receivable, ISS and Waybill ledgers and
reports. 0.80


FCC Begin review of cash receipts and disbursements to
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HOURS
update the wind down budget, reconciliation cutoff
and allocation issues between MMA and CMQ. 0.80


FCC Review of audit workpapers received from Greg
Sanborn regarding $2.0 million grant received from
Quebec in 2010. 0.30


06/17/2014 FCC Review RMI-generated reports to complete Customs and
APHIS reports from April 2013 through May 2014, and
separate follow-up meetings with Allison Jewel and
Bob Grindrod regarding discrepancy in historical
reports filed and RMI supporting reports. 0.50


06/18/2014 FCC Complete U.S. Customs and APHIS user fee reports for
the period of May 2013 through May 2014, prepare
draft correspondence and e-mail to Bob Keach for
review and approval. 1.80


FCC Research zone switching issues and car revenue
expense for outstanding invoices from the CN Railway
and meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding same;
telephone call with Karen Graham (CN) regarding
same. 0.90


FCC Meeting with Tom Tardif regarding the Millinocket,
ME, tax bills. 0.20


FCC Review and approve cash disbursement request for
both MMA and MCC for the week ending 6/20/14. 0.30


06/19/2014 FCC Review the schedule received from CN regarding
unpaid Car Hire reclaims (.3) and telephone call
with John Garai (CN) regarding reconciliation of
same (.3). 0.60


06/23/2014 FCC Update the U.S. and Canada wind down budgets for
activity for the week ending 6/20/14. 1.20


FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson and Tom Iacona
regarding Canadian funding issues. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding Canadian
funding and closing issues. 0.20


FCC At the request of CDN Monitor, update the CDN
forecast through 7/18/14. 0.60


06/24/2014 FCC Review post-10/18/13 for past due accounts and brief
meeting with Torrie Potter regarding same. 0.40


FCC Meeting with Sachi Mishra and John Fessenden
regarding cash transfers and planning this week's
disbursements. 0.30


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter regarding status of this
week's Canadian payroll, reconciliation of payroll
clearing account and work plan for this week. 0.40


FCC Respond to information request from Shawn Travitsky
regarding Canada forecast for July and additional
information regarding U.S. closing. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Kristin Redstone regarding
status of required tax filings for Canada. 0.30


06/25/2014 FCC Prepare collateral report for the week ending
6/20/14, including review of U.S. and Canada
accounts receivable, ISS and Unsettled Waybill
reports, and e-mail same for distribution to Mike
Fagone. 0.70


FCC Meeting with John Fessenden regarding cash planning
for the rest of the week, including approval for
disbursements and reimbursement to CMQ for accounts
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HOURS
receivable checks received by MMA. 0.70


06/26/2014 FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding review of the
Car Hire claims against MMA by CN. 0.40


FCC Meeting with Sachi Mishra, Jim Speed and Torrie
Potter regarding closing reconciliation and open
issues for MMA's May general ledger. 0.90


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Brenda Tarr regarding
questions regarding account reconciliations for
12/31/13 and 3/31/14. 0.50


06/30/2014 FCC Review and approve Canadian tax form T106 for
execution by the trustee. 0.30


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter to reconcile intercompany
account with LMS. 0.80


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter to review and reconcile
the due from/to account with Railworld and
corresponding grant receivable account for $2.0
million. 1.50


FCC Update schedule for accrued professional fees
incurred and paid at 12/31/13, 3/31/14 and 5/31/14
for both U.S. and Canada professionals. 0.70


07/01/2014 FCC Review cash receipts and disbursements for the week
ended 6/27/14 and update the budget-versus-actual
results and revised wind down budget for same,
including review of reimbursements to CMQ for
deposit of CMQ's accounts receivable proceeds into
MMA's operating accounts. 1.10


FCC Begin reconciliation of Canadian accounts payable
detailed invoice ledger to accounts payable aging
report and general ledger, noting multiple
discrepancies between the reports for follow up. 1.30


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter, John Fessenden and
Brenda Tarr regarding discrepancies between the
various accounts payable reports. 0.50


FCC Review and reconcile MMA share of $659,600 due to
the ISS for payment of freight revenue owed to other
carriers and forward same to Sachi Mishra. 0.80


07/02/2014 FCC Prepare collateral report for the week ended 6/27/14
and e-mail same to Mike Fagone for distribution. 0.70


FCC Pursuant to a request from Mike Fagone, prepare
schedule of pre-petition accounts receivable for
U.S. and Canada freight accounts and MMA's
miscellaneous accounts; e-mail same to Mike. 1.00


FCC Review and approve cash disbursements for both MMA
and MCC and brief meeting with John Fessenden
regarding same. 0.40


07/03/2014 FCC Review the 2014 allocation journal entries and
telephone call with Torrie Potter regarding comments
for fuel allocation. 0.30


07/07/2014 FCC Review receipt and disbursement activity for the
week ended 7/4/14 and update the
budget-versus-actual report and confirm all accounts
receivable deposits and corresponding reimbursements
for CMQ. 1.20


07/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with Torrie Potter regarding
calculation of car hire expense required to be paid
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HOURS
to Midwest and Flex Leasing, and unemployment taxes
for the second quarter. 0.20


07/10/2014 FCC Review the draft of May financial statements for MMA
and MCC and telephone call with Jim Speed regarding
same. 0.60


FCC Review and approve this week's cash disbursement
request of MMA and MCC. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Tim McKelin regarding questions
for settlement motion for BSB. 0.20


07/11/2014 FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding land
occupation rental lease receipts for second quarter
and status of CMQ audit for 12/31/13 land request by
CMQ for me to sign the management representation
letter for the audit. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Gaynor Ryan regarding status of
medical claim run-off estimate. 0.20


07/14/2014 FCC Review receipts and disbursements for prior week and
update wind down budget for same. 1.20


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding status of car
hire revenue and expense issues with the CN. 0.40


FCC Review and approve payment of $27,000 for the second
quarter federal unemployment tax. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Pam Border regarding invoices
received from Carl Lisman for Vermont real estate
recordings for the Camden financing and sale of U.S.
track. 0.30


FCC Prepare Wheeling collateral report for weeks ended
7/4/14 and 7/11/14, including review of accounts
receivable, accounts payable ledgers, Unsettled
Waybill reports and ISS settlement report for both
periods. 1.70


07/15/2014 FCC Review car repair bills received from Jerry Keller
and prepare comments for follow up. 0.30


07/16/2014 FCC Brief meeting with Torrie Potter regarding
information request from Ann Healy at Irving Paper;
telephone call with Ann regarding same and follow-up
instruction to Torrie for response. 0.30


07/17/2014 FCC Review and approve disbursement request of MMA and
MCC for current week. 0.30


07/22/2014 FCC Review receipts and disbursements for week ended
7/18/14, telephone call with John Fessenden
regarding clarification for certain deposits, and
update wind down budget. 1.20


FCC Review summary of current billings for land
occupation agreements and outstanding unpaid
balances on MCC books and e-mail Bob Keach with
proposed resolution regarding same. 0.90


07/25/2014 FCC Telephone call with Torrie Potter regarding
allocation issues for car hire revenue; e-mail Sachi
Mishra regarding same. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Jerry Keller regarding car
repair invoices received for May. 0.20


FCC Review cash activity received from John Fessenden. 0.10
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HOURS
07/28/2014 FCC Review cash activity for the week ending 7/25/14,


including reimbursable between CMQ, MMA and MCC, and
update wind down budget for same. 0.90


FCC Review past due receivables for collection activity
for MMA freight and miscellaneous accounts
receivable ledgers. 0.30


07/29/2014 FCC Review the updated ISS settlement detail for 8/2/14
payment and telephone call with Jim Speed regarding
same. 0.30


07/30/2014 FCC Telephone call with Sachi Mishra regarding the
collection fee proposal for the MMA past due
receivables not subject to the Wheeling lien claims. 0.30


FCC Review information received from First Union Railcar
regarding past due car hire expense and telephone
call with Audrey Boreli at FUR regarding same. 0.40


07/31/2014 FCC Review and approve disbursements for the week and
reimbursement to CMQ for approximately $100,000 of
CMQ accounts receivable funds deposited into MMA's
accounts. 0.40


08/01/2014 FCC Review Baker Newman's open points memorandum and
review accrued accounts payable and property tax
schedule; telephone call with Torrie Potter
regarding car hire expense accrual for 12/31/13 and
3/31/14. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Chris Ryan regarding review of
Baker Newman's open points list for the audit. 1.00


08/04/2014 FCC Prepare for (.3) and attend conference call with
Baker Newman and KPMG regarding open audit issues
(1.0). 1.30


FCC Two telephone calls with Melinda Irish regarding
accounts payable and accrued expense issues; e-mail
Melinda multiple schedules for same. 0.60


08/06/2014 FCC Telephone call with Bob Defloria with Valero
regarding final billing for tank car used for diesel
storage; follow-up e-mail to Sachi Mishra regarding
same. 0.20


FCC Morning meeting with Melinda Irish regarding open
points for the audit, including final reconciliation
of accounts payable open points. 1.20


FCC Review receipts and disbursements for the week
ending 8/1/14 and update the wind down budget for
same. 1.10


FCC Review workpapers prepared by Bob Grindrod and
information supplied by RMI regarding reclaim
amounts for CN car hire and approve $24,000 payment
to CN for same; telephone call with Karen Graham at
CN regarding same and confirmation of $16,000
receivable from CN and timing of receipt. 0.80


FCC Analysis to resolve open points for audit, analyze
car hire issues for Anderson, review potential
accrual for damage incurred for leased locomotives
and reconciliation of the restructuring accrual and
related expense for MCC; meeting with Melinda Irish
regarding same. 2.20


08/07/2014 FCC Meeting with John Fessenden regarding status of
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HOURS
allocation worksheet between MMA, MCC and CMQ. 0.30


FCC Analyze payroll and ISS settlement reports, and
prepare reimbursement request to CMQ for $45,000;
e-mail same to Sachi Mishra for approval. 0.50


FCC Complete ERM Form 16 for workmen's compensation
insurance and e-mail same to Alan Darhar for
submission to MEMIC. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding update on
operations and financial wind down issues for MMA
and MCC. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Sachi Mishra
regarding proposal allocation for the May car hire
revenue and payment of required expense to Midwest
Rail and CIT-Flex; follow-up call with Rick Folio
with Midwest regarding same. 0.50


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter, Brenda Tarr and Jerry
Keller regarding allocation of June car repair
revenue and expense, including billings to other
railways. 0.60


FCC Two telephone calls with Melinda Irish regarding
reconciliation of Canadian accrued professional fees
and restructuring expense, prepare schedule
reconciling same and e-mail confirmatory request to
Growlings regarding open points. 1.80


FCC Follow-up telephone call with Melinda Irish
regarding potential loss accrual for damaged
engines. 0.30


FCC Review ending inventory report for MMA and beginning
inventory report for CMQ, meeting with Jim Speed
regarding suggested methodology to reconcile
differences and follow-up meeting with Jim, Sachi
Mishra and Brian Files regarding reasons for
variance and proper recording of opening entry for
CMQ's books. 1.30


FCC Telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding protest
of Derby real estate taxes. 0.20


FCC Meeting with Sachi Mishra regarding status of my
proposal to collect MCC miscellaneous accounts
receivable. 0.20


08/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding spare
parts inventory reconciliation between CMQ and MMA
perpetual inventory as of 5/15/14 and prepare
schedule for audit journal entry as of 12/31/14 and
e-mail same to Melinda. 1.50


08/11/2014 FCC Telephone call with Mike Fagone regarding transfer
of funds from MMA escrow to Bernstein's escrow for
distribution made to Wheeling. 0.20


FCC Review receipts and disbursements for the week ended
8/8/14, including verification of CMQ accounts
receivable received by MMA and subsequent transfer
for same and update wind down budget for same. 1.20


08/14/2014 FCC Telephone call with Alison Alexander with CIT
regarding Car Hire Revenue for May, prepare e-mail
outlining terms of final financial settlement for 6
leases with CIT and Flex between CIT, CMQ and MMA
regarding final payment of Car Hire Revenue for May
through final return of cars or new leases between
CIT and CMQ, and e-mail same to Alison and Sachi
Mishra. 1.10


Case 13-10670    Doc 1168-1    Filed 10/24/14    Entered 10/24/14 13:54:30    Desc
 Exhibit A    Page 11 of 62







Page: 11
Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/08/2014


 
 


HOURS


08/18/2014 FCC Review wire transfer request for Federal Railway
Administration and to Bernstein for payment to
Wheeling and meeting with John Fessenden regarding
same. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with George Marcus and Alex Jarvis
regarding status of the Canadian Pacific Railway
collection effort and return of empty cars. 0.30


08/19/2014 FCC Review receipts and disbursements for the week ended
8/15/14 and update the wind down budget for same. 0.90


08/20/2014 FCC Telephone call with Doug Gipes, manager of fleet
maintenance for First Union Railcar, regarding
maintenance invoices for returned cars. 0.20


FCC Review and approve cash disbursements for weeks
ended 8/15/14 and 8/22/14 and reimbursement to CMQ
for accounts receivable deposits and brief meeting
with John Fessenden regarding same. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Brenda Tarr regarding reimbursement to
Louisiana Pacific for prepayments received for cars
not delivered. 0.30


08/21/2014 FCC E-mail exchange with Carl Lisman and Sam Anderson
regarding status of the Vermont tax notice for
transfer taxes. 0.20


08/22/2014 FCC Begin MMA closing review for May, June and July
2014, and e-mail Torrie Potter regarding schedules
for review. 1.20


08/25/2014 FCC Review receipts and disbursements for the week ended
8/22/14 and update the wind down budget for same. 0.70


FCC Telephone call with Shawn Travitsky regarding status
of wind down open issues for MCC. 0.20


08/27/2014 FCC Telephone call with Shawn Travitsky regarding
questions of MCC cash activity for the last two
months, payment of real estate taxes and collection
of outstanding accounts receivable. 0.30


FCC Review invoice statements received from the CN
Railway for car hire reclaim issues and telephone
call with Greg Bryson (CN) regarding same. 0.40


09/02/2014 FCC Review of receipts and disbursements for the week
ended 8/29/14 and update the wind down budget for
same. 0.80


FCC Respond to information request from Kristin
Redstone, MMA's tax preparer at Baker Newman, and
follow up with MMA and MCC counsel regarding fee
categories for 2013 in order to determine
deductibility. 1.10


09/04/2014 FCC At request of the trustee, update the analysis of
the U.S. closing statement and payments from escrow
through 9/4/14; telephone call with Mike Fagone
regarding same. 0.80


FCC Review car hire claims received from G&W Railway and
telephone call with Linda McKeown at G&W regarding
same. 0.40


09/05/2014 FCC Telephone call with Kim Thompson regarding review of
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the unsettlement waybills, reasons for uncleared
status and potential write off of same. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Diane at Progress Rail regarding
status of lease for a grapple and boom; e-mail to
Ryan Ratledge and Ron Marshall regarding CMQ's use
of this equipment. 0.40


09/08/2014 FCC At request of the trustee, prepare bridge analysis
comparing prior U.S. closing estimate and final
closing statement, and e-mail same to the trustee. 0.80


FCC Telephone call with Shawn Travitsky regarding
questions on analysis of the U.S. closing escrow. 0.20


09/09/2014 FCC Review receipts and disbursements for the week ended
9/5/14, update the wind down budget for same, review
the Derby payroll detail and e-mail the
reimbursement request to Sachi Mishra. 0.80


FCC Meeting with Don Gardner to review documents on
MMA's "W" Drive, including documents for the 2010
sale of the northern Maine track and the
corresponding payment of the sub-debt holders. 1.60


09/10/2014 FCC Review the unpaid real estate tax invoices received
from Canadian municipalities, compare to original
tax schedule for closing, telephone call with Sam
Anderson regarding same and meeting with Sachi
Mishra regarding treatment. 1.10


FCC Telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding the lease
with Progressive Rail, formerly FMC, and separate
telephone calls with Ryan Ratledge and Sachi Mistra
regarding treatment for same. 0.60


09/11/2014 FCC Meeting with John Fessenden to review and approve
the disbursements for this week. 0.30


09/15/2014 FCC Review cash receipts and disbursements for the week
ending 9/12/14 and update wind down budget for same. 0.80


09/16/2014 FCC Telephone call with Leslie Rafford of Fraser Timber
regarding a pre-petition customer refund due to
Fraser; e-mail to the trustee regarding same and
respond to Ms. Rafford regarding inability to
process the refund. 0.30


FCC Multiple telephone calls and e-mails with John
Fessenden and Jill Saucier (TD Bank) regarding
fraudulent checks presented for payment on MMA's
account at TD Bank, e-mail to Bob Keach regarding
same. 0.50


09/17/2014 FCC Continue follow up on fraudulent check issue on
MMA's TD operating account and telephone call with
Jill Saucier at TD regarding same. 0.30


FCC At the request of the trustee, update professional
fee analysis as of 8/31/14 and e-mail him the
analysis regarding same. 0.80


09/18/2014 FCC Review accounts payable ledger for MMA and MCC and
approve disbursements for the week. 0.30


09/22/2014 FCC Review receipts and disbursements for the week ended
9/19/14 and update the wind down budget for same;
calculate and e-mail Derby's payroll reimbursement
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to Sachi Mishra. 0.70


FCC Update Wheeling's collateral analysis from the week
ended 7/11/14 through 9/19/14 and confirm that no
additional payments are due to Wheeling for the
indicated time frame. 0.90


FCC Telephone call with Jon Young at Flynn Wirkus Young
regarding status of the litigation budget for
wrongful death claim; e-mail Bob Keach regarding
same. 0.20


FCC Review car payable invoice received from BNSF and
telephone call with Joan Pierre regarding request
for more detail; review detail received and e-mail
approval for payment to John Fessenden. 0.30


09/23/2014 FCC Review motion for MCC's extension for time to file
the plan and payment request for the Canadian
professional fees. 0.20


09/24/2014 FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding status of
wind down budget, scope of preference analysis,
review of January 2011 track sale and other
miscellaneous topics (.2); follow-up call with Bob
Keach to complete discussion on these topics (.4). 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Merrilynn Hardin (Aetna)
regarding refund of stop-loss tail policy (.2);
analyze information received from Merrilynn
regarding same (.5). 0.70


09/26/2014 FCC E-mail to John Giles and Ken Nicholson regarding
payment of final severance checks; e-mail to Gaynor
Ryan regarding approval of same. 0.20


09/30/2014 FCC Review and update true up schedule prepared by John
Fessenden regarding allocation issues between MMA
and CMQ. 0.30


Business Analysis 130.90 82,104.00


05/19/2014 MEF E-mail document request list for the April monthly
operating report to the MMA accounting department. 0.10


05/20/2014 MEF Update the monthly operating report template for
April. 0.30


MEF Reconcile miscellaneous receivables aging to trial
balance, reformat aging and add to the April monthly
operating report. 0.80


MEF Review summary of payroll taxes; update the monthly
operating report accordingly. 0.40


05/21/2014 MEF Review payables aging, update to remove pre-petition
payables, reformat, and add to the April monthly
operating report. 1.70


MEF Reconcile all bank statements except for CIBC Canada
account. 0.80


MEF Begin to reconcile CIBC Canada account; e-mail T.
Potter regarding same. 0.50


MEF Update April monthly operating report to include
disbursements by bank account, categorize
disbursements and e-mail J. Fessenden regarding
categorizations. 0.90


05/27/2014 MEF Begin to update the April monthly operating report
for the balance sheet, review against the trial
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balance, exchange e-mails and have conversations
with T. Potter regarding discrepancy between trial
balance and balance sheet and finalize
reconciliation of book to bank balances for CIBC
Canada account. 1.20


MEF E-mail J. Fessenden regarding certain post-petition
invoice; update the monthly operating report
accordingly. 0.10


MEF Review income statement; add to the April monthly
operating report. 0.30


05/28/2014 MEF E-mail J. Fessenden regarding certain disbursements. 0.10
MEF Compile bank statement and tax receipt attachments;


finalize draft monthly operating report for April. 0.50


05/29/2014 MEF Review draft monthly operating report and e-mail to
and discuss with F. Caruso; e-mail completed monthly
operating report to B. Keach. 0.50


FCC Review the draft April monthly operating report
prepared by Matt Farnsworth, telephone call with
Matt regarding questions and approve same for
filing. 0.70


06/18/2014 FCC Telephone call with Matt Farnsworth regarding
preparation of the May monthly operating report. 0.20


MEF Send e-mail to and have conversation with F. Caruso
regarding the May monthly operating report; e-mail
MMA's accounting team with the monthly operating
report document requests. 0.30


06/20/2014 MEF Update monthly operating report template for May. 0.30
MEF Review summary of payroll taxes; update the monthly


operating report accordingly. 0.40
MEF Review payables aging, update to remove pre-petition


payables, reformat and add to the May monthly
operating report. 1.00


07/14/2014 MEF Exchange e-mails with accounting department
regarding status of document request. 0.10


07/16/2014 MEF Reconcile miscellaneous receivables aging to trial
balance, reformat aging, and add to May monthly
operating report. 0.80


MEF Review TD operating account and update disbursements
listing with ACH and wire transfer data; begin to
categorize disbursements. 1.10


07/22/2014 MEF Review and update disbursements listing, e-mail to
J. Fessenden for review and revise based on J.
Fessenden's comments. 0.40


MEF Continue to reconcile the TD operating account;
e-mail list of questions to T. Potter regarding
certain receipts and disbursements. 1.70


MEF Continue to reconcile the CIBC CDN account, e-mail
list of questions to T. Potter regarding certain
receipts and disbursements. 1.50


MEF Reconcile the CIBC U.S., Bank of America Car Hire,
and Bangor Savings accounts; update the May monthly
operating report accordingly. 0.50


MEF Review receipts file against bank statements and
categorize deposits by bank statements for the
monthly operating report. 1.00
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07/23/2014 MEF Review the e-mail from T. Potter regarding TD's
operating account bank reconciliation; update the
May monthly operating report accordingly. 0.20


MEF Review e-mail from T. Potter regarding the CIBC
Canada account bank reconciliation, begin to update
the monthly operating report and e-mail follow-up
questions to T. Potter regarding reconciliation. 1.20


07/24/2014 FCC Review draft monthly operating report for May and
meeting with Matt Farnsworth regarding same;
telephone call with Bob Keach regarding treatment of
his client fund escrow account. 0.60


MEF Conversation with F. Caruso regarding footnote to
receipt from Bernstein Shur; update the monthly
operating report accordingly. 0.10


MEF E-mail the MMA accounting department with request
for information needed to prepare the June monthly
operating report. 0.10


MEF Compile bank statement and tax receipt attachments;
finalize the draft monthly operating report for May. 0.50


07/25/2014 MEF Conversation with F. Caruso regarding the sale
escrow summary, review files, create summary of
escrow detail through May, update cash receipts and
disbursements file to accommodate escrow account and
e-mail updated schedules to F. Caruso. 0.70


MEF Assemble and finalize the May monthly operating
report and e-mail to B. Keach. 0.30


MEF Update the monthly operating report template for
June. 0.40


MEF Update escrow detail for June transactions. 0.40


07/28/2014 MEF Review tax payment confirmations for June; exchange
e-mails with J. Fessenden regarding Vermont income
tax withholding. 0.20


MEF Update the June monthly operating report for check
and certain wire disbursements. 0.40


07/31/2014 MEF E-mail T. Potter regarding status of June documents
requests. 0.10


08/06/2014 MEF Review June bank statements and disbursements
listings, estimate amount of disbursements for June,
and e-mail summary of Q2 2014 disbursements to F.
Caruso. 0.30


MEF Review TD operating account, update disbursements
listing for wire and ACH transactions, as well as
match up deposits to receipts report, reconcile TD
Bank operating account and update the June monthly
operating report accordingly. 1.80


MEF Review bank statements and reconcile deposits for
each account against receipts listing. 0.50


MEF Review Bernstein Shur's escrow account and
correspondence related to certain transactions;
update escrow account activity for the June monthly
operating report. 0.50


08/07/2014 MEF Review and update cover page and questionnaire for
the June monthly operating report; add footnotes to
both. 0.40


MEF Update the June monthly operating report for list of
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outstanding checks. 0.10


MEF Continue to reconcile CIBC USD bank account,
complete reconciliation and update summary of cash
receipts and disbursements. 0.70


MEF Update receipts listing and disbursements listing
for Bank of America, Bangor Savings and TD escrow
accounts; reconcile those accounts. 0.50


08/08/2014 MEF Continue to reconcile CIBC Canada bank account,
complete reconciliation and update summary of cash
receipts and disbursements. 1.00


MEF Review and reconcile accounts receivable reports to
the trial balance; update the June monthly operating
report accordingly. 1.00


MEF Compile and scan bank statements, payroll tax
deposits, and other tax deposits for the June
monthly operating report. 0.20


MEF Categorize disbursements for the June monthly
operating report; e-mail to J. Fessenden for review. 0.70


08/11/2014 FCC Review the draft June monthly operating report
prepared by Matt Farnsworth for the Canadian sale
activity and payment of professional fees (.5),
telephone call with Matt regarding corrections (.2);
review the final draft and e-mail Bob Keach for
execution (.2). 0.90


MEF Make revisions to the June monthly operating report,
re-compile revised sheets, finalize June monthly
operating report and e-mail to F. Caruso. 0.70


08/18/2014 MEF E-mail accounting department with information
request for the July monthly operating report;
e-mail J. Fessenden regarding June disbursements
listing. 0.10


09/03/2014 MEF Review files received to-date; send follow-up
request to T. Potter and J. Speed. 0.10


09/04/2014 MEF Conversation with T. Potter regarding status of the
July bank reconciliations and statements, review
statements and reconciliations, have L. Lakeberg
scan same and e-mail them to T. Potter. 0.40


09/06/2014 MEF Review files and e-mail correspondence for escrow
detail through July, e-mail W. Hueske to request
updated escrow detail, review updated escrow detail,
and update July monthly operating report
accordingly. 0.40


MEF Update the monthly operating report template for
July. 0.40


MEF Review accounts payable, remove pre-petition
payables and update the July monthly operating
report. 0.50


MEF Reconcile all bank statements; update summary of
receipts and disbursements accordingly. 1.50


MEF Review and reconcile the accounts receivable reports
to the trial balance; update July monthly operating
report accordingly. 0.50


MEF Categorize disbursements for the July monthly
operating report. 0.40


MEF Reconcile deposits for each account against receipts
listing. 0.50
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09/08/2014 MEF Review payroll tax payment schedule from J.
Fessenden; update the schedule of post-petition
liabilities accordingly. 0.40


MEF Compile, review and finalize the draft July monthly
operating report; e-mail to F. Caruso. 0.80


09/09/2014 FCC Review the draft monthly operating report for July
(.2) and telephone call with Matt Farnsworth
regarding comments (.2). 0.40


MEF Make revisions to the July monthly operating report,
finalize and e-mail to B. Keach. 0.30


09/19/2014 MEF Update the monthly operating report template for
August. 0.40


MEF Review payroll tax payments; update the August
monthly operating report accordingly. 0.40


MEF Review escrow summary; update the monthly operating
report for August activity. 0.30


Monthly Bktcy/Semi-Annual Rpts 40.50 11,580.00


05/02/2014 TFC Telephone call with Eric Sweitzer to discuss goals
for MMA data extraction. 0.40 n/c


TFC Create a VLOOKUP table to bring in account
descriptions into our general ledger file so we
could format it like a balance sheet and profit and
loss statement. 2.80 n/c


05/05/2014 TFC Telephone call with E. Sweitzer to discuss MMA's
cash disbursement tie out for data extraction
project. 0.30 n/c


TFC Create two schedules to tie out cash disbursements
and cash receipts. 2.50 n/c


05/07/2014 TFC E-mail to D. Houghton regarding MMA data extraction. 0.10 n/c
TFC Correct my tie out schedule based upon E. Sweitzer's


comments. 0.80 n/c
TFC Update my tie out schedule based upon D. Houghton's


comments. 0.50 n/c


05/08/2014 TFC Create summary of cash disbursements other than
accounts payable or manual checks. 0.20 n/c


TFC Address E. Sweitzer's comments regarding our cash
disbursement tie out schedule. 0.70 n/c


05/12/2014 TFC Add descriptions to create pivot tables for MMR, MMC
and MCC to create the balance sheet and profit and
loss. 1.70 n/c


TFC Add pivot table tab to general ledger for other cash
disbursements. 0.30 n/c


TFC Telephone call with E. Sweitzer regarding MMA's data
extraction. 0.10 n/c


05/27/2014 TFC Tie out the payroll detail to the general ledger for
our data extraction project. 1.00 n/c


06/12/2014 MEF Conversation with F. Caruso regarding preference
analysis; e-mail E. Sweitzer regarding cash
disbursement files. 0.20


06/16/2014 MEF Conversation with T. Caruso regarding MMA
disbursement data, e-mail E. Sweitzer regarding same
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and e-mail D. Houghton regarding running an
additional disbursement report. 0.30


MEF Review and update the disbursement data; create
summaries to view potential preferences by dollar
amount and vendor. 1.30


06/17/2014 MEF Exchange e-mails with T. Potter regarding May-August
2013 bank statements. 0.10


MEF Create separate tab of 2013 disbursements, pull
together check clear data, e-mail new tab to L.
Lakeberg and have discussion regarding inputting
clear dates to disbursement data. 1.00


06/18/2014 MEF Conversation with L. Lakeberg regarding status of
preference data file, review and clean up file, add
wire transfer data, re-run preliminary analysis of
90-day preference candidates and e-mail the draft
list to F. Caruso. 1.40


09/16/2014 MEF Review files and update initial preference analysis
candidate listing with corrected date range; e-mail
to F. Caruso. 1.00


09/17/2014 MEF Update preference analysis to split between pre- and
post-accident; e-mail to F. Caruso. 1.40


Preference Analysis 6.70 1,742.00


05/01/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.60


05/02/2014 FCC Telephone call with Tom Tardif regarding whistle
stop agreement and Canadian signal status. 0.30


FCC Attend the daily management meeting via telephone
regarding status of the operations. 0.70


FCC Telephone call with Tim Scalia and Ryan Ratledge
regarding status of locomotive usage and preparation
for turnover of the BSB locomotives. 0.70


05/05/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of operations. 0.50


05/06/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Chris Caldwell regarding resolution of
a customer dispute. 0.70


05/07/2014 FCC Attend the management meeting regarding status of
the operations. 0.70


FCC Meeting with John Giles regarding the transition
issues for the U.S. closing, including employee
termination issues and continued operation of Canada
by MCC post-U.S. closing. 1.00


FCC Review the draft settlement agreement from First
Union Railcar and telephone call with Maureen
Horrigan regarding same. 0.50


05/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with Maureen Horrigan regarding
status of the settlement term sheet with First Union
Railcar. 0.20


05/09/2014 FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge and Gaynor Ryan regarding
coordination for notification to the Derby employees
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for those rehired and temporary "leased" employee
status regarding the Derby Shop lease agreement with
the CMQ. 0.80


FCC Attend daily management meeting regarding status of
the operations. 0.50


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding retention of
paper records in Canada. 0.40


05/12/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod and Ryan Ratledge
regarding transition issues for locomotive use and
use of U.S. and Canadian crews for Newport to
Farnham train service. 0.90


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach and Don Gardner
regarding extension of the U.S. and Canadian
liability policies until June 2014 (.3); follow-up
telephone call with Bob Keach regarding the Federal
Employees Liability Act and workmen's compensation
insurance issues discussed with Mr. Bleach (.2). 0.50


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding criminal arrest
of three employees in Canada; follow-up calls with
Bob Keach and Canadian counsel regarding same. 0.70


05/13/2014 FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding status of
criminal arrest of three MCC employees and today's
court hearing. 0.40


FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations (.6); continue the meeting with
Bob Grindrod, Ryan Ratledge and Gaynor Ryan
regarding the Megantic situation and termination of
today's train service in Megantic as a safety
precaution (.4). 1.00


FCC Meeting with Chris Caldwell and a customer regarding
unapplied large credit balance in accounts
receivable (accounts payable) incurred pre-petition. 0.50


FCC Meeting with Don Gardner regarding insurance renewal
for both the U.S. and Canada for June and telephone
call with Don Gardner and Peter Bleach regarding
same. 0.50


05/14/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.50


05/15/2014 FCC Telephone call with Maureen Horrigan regarding the
settlement agreement and final return date for
stored cars (.2); meeting with Bob Grindrod
regarding same (.3). 0.50


FCC Conduct meeting with MMA's accounting staff and
Sachi Misha, the new CFO for CMQ, regarding the wind
down of the general ledger for MMA, revenue and
disbursement issues for the U.S. closing, funding
mechanism for continued Canadian operations, cut off
issues for ISS, payment of real estate taxes and
change in utilities. 1.80


05/16/2014 FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding requested
modification of the severance agreements for five
employees and e-mail Sam Anderson regarding same. 0.30


FCC Meeting with Brian Files regarding procedure for
continued funding and purchase approval for the
Canadian operations. 0.30
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FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding logistics for


returning remaining cars in storage for First Union
Railcar. 0.30


05/19/2014 FCC Meeting with Jon Beals regarding request for 100 new
battery packs for 10 crossings in Canada; follow-up
meeting with John Marshall regarding same. 0.40


05/20/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.80


FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge regarding status
of the BSB locomotives and battery pack issue in
Canada (.3); follow-up meeting with Jon Beals
regarding battery pack issue and approve purchase
order for 100 packs for crossings in Canada (.4). 0.70


FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding coordination
for the return of 160 empty oil tanker cars and
reimbursement for the cost for same (.3); follow-up
meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding same (.2) and
e-mail Mike Fagone regarding potential settlement
with Canadian Pacific and necessary consent from
Wheeling for same (.1). 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach and Don Gardner
regarding extension of property and liability
policies for the U.S. and Canada, payment of
commissions for same, and status of extensions for
the D&O and employment practices policies. 0.40


FCC Meeting with Gaynor Ryan regarding processing
vacation pay for terminated employees, review
revised severance agreement and meeting with Don
Gardner regarding his final comments. 0.60


FCC Review and approve Bob Grindrod's draft of the
extension of the Certificate of Fitness required by
the CTA. 0.40


FCC Initial review of files related to car hire revenue
and expense and meeting with an employee regarding
same. 0.50


05/21/2014 FCC Attend the conference call with Patrick Maxie and
Bob Keach regarding the D&O insurance issues. 0.30


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding completion of
the application for the Canadian Certificate of
Fitness. 0.40


05/22/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.80


05/23/2014 FCC Review draft of the Certificate of Fitness for
Canadian operations prepared by Bob Grindrod, and
separate telephone calls with Sam Anderson and Bob
Keach regarding follow-up issues for certain pieces
of real estate. 0.70


05/27/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge regarding Canadian
operations and repair issues. 0.50


FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding status of
D&O policy extension and follow-up telephone call
with Peter Bleach regarding same; e-mail Bob
Grindrod regarding status. 0.40
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05/28/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status


of the operations. 0.70
FCC Multiple separate phone calls with David Houghton


and Tim Shannon regarding coordination of electronic
backup for the workstations, laptops and smart
phones clarification of requirements for same. 1.20


FCC Telephone call with Bob Grindrod regarding Canadian
operating issues, including the Stanbridge
subdivision issue and Derby lease issues. 0.40


FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge regarding track
repair and maintenance issues in Canada. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Bob Grindrod and Kim Thompson
regarding return of empty oil tank cars and
calculation of amounts due from Canadian Pacific. 0.40


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding status of
issues requiring resolution, including D&O policy,
Canadian Certificate of Fitness, adequacy of
Canadian funding through 6/15/14, RWD request to
release certain inventory and other miscellaneous
topics. 0.40


FCC Review RWD's request to return certain inventory
owned by RWD and e-mail Bob Keach regarding same. 0.30


FCC Prepare information response for Peter Bleach
regarding D&O policy renewal; e-mail same to Peter,
including telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding
clarification of certain Canadian real estate
parcels owned by MMA-U.S. 0.70


05/29/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge regarding Canadian
operational and maintenance issues. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach regarding status of
D&O policy renewal issues. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Bob Grindrod regarding the
Stanbridge subdivision repairs, status of D&O and
Canadian Certificate of Fitness, return of formerly
leased cars and other miscellaneous topics. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Pierre Legault regarding the
return of Canadian Pacific empty oil tankers. 0.30


05/30/2014 FCC Attend the daily management regarding status of the
operations. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge regarding fuel for
Canadian and Newport subdivision operations. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding pending
return of Canadian Pacific empty oil cars and status
of operations in Canada and funding for same. 0.40


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding D&O policy
renewal issues. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Bob Grindrod regarding status of
car return issues and repair exposure regarding
same. 0.30


06/02/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting via telephone
regarding status of operations. 0.60


06/03/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of operations. 0.60


FCC Meeting with David Houghton regarding status of
electronic backup of all servers and workstations. 0.20


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding status of the
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HOURS
leased car return and rebuttal billing for car
repairs. 0.30


06/04/2014 FCC Attend the daily operations meeting regarding status
of operations, including restart of the East-West
line and status of various maintenance projects in
Canada. 0.90


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding status of return
of railcars subject to rejected leases and lease
negotiations for same by the CMQ (.4); follow-up
meeting with Jay Lander (CMQ) regarding same (.3). 0.70


FCC Review the weekly disbursement requests and detailed
invoices for same to proof allocation issues between
MMA and CMQ. 0.40


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding First Union
Railcar return issues (.3), continuing meeting with
telephone call with Maureen Horrigan (FUR) regarding
same (.7). 1.00


FCC Conference call with Bob Grindrod, Jay Lander, Ryan
Ratledge and representatives for Narcat regarding
status of leased cars (.6); follow-up meeting with
Jay Lander regarding same (.2). 0.80


06/05/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of operations. 0.70


FCC Meeting with Sachi Mishra regarding Canadian capital
expenditure issues. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding approval for
Canadian capital projects and reimbursement for CMQ
for same. 0.20


06/06/2014 FCC Attend daily management meeting via phone regarding
status of operations. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge, Jay Lander, Chuck
Brown and other representatives of Narcat regarding
status of 200 railcars formerly leased by MMA,
temporary lease for same and return issues. 0.80


06/09/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of Canadian operations. 0.50


06/10/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Jerry Keller regarding status of car
repairs for two railcars leased from Narcat. 0.20


FCC E-mail to Chuck Brown at Narcat regarding car repair
issues. 0.20


FCC Conference call with Bob Keach, Sam Anderson and
Mike Fagone regarding open points for the Canadian
sale and estate wind down issues. 0.50


FCC Meeting with David Houghton regarding status of
electronic backup. 0.30


FCC Review Canadian review and meeting with Gaynor Ryan,
and follow-up call with Ron Marshall regarding
overtime hours. 0.40


06/11/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.70


FCC Meeting with Bob Keach and Bob Grindrod regarding
status of the Canadian operations, wind down of MMA
and closing issues for MCC. 0.70


FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding Canadian
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operational issues. 0.70


FCC Telephone call with Maureen Horrigan regarding
status of return of the First Union railcars. 0.20


06/12/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.50


FCC Conference call with Dave Houghton and Chris Falk
(Reliable Network) regarding status of electronic
backup of all servers and workstations, including
demonstration of access to information. 0.70


06/13/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.70


06/16/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting via telephone
regarding status of the operations. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach and Sam Anderson
regarding inventory request from RWD, status of Bob
Grindrod's severance agreement, BSB locomotive
issues and closing issues. 0.50


06/17/2014 FCC Attend management meeting regarding status of the
operations. 0.70


FCC Meeting with Brian Files regarding tainted diesel
fuel in Farnham and approved resource of new vendor. 0.40


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding Canadian
operating issues, including filings required for
East-West service reconnection. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding status of car
return for rejected leases. 0.30


06/18/2014 FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding operating
issues in Canada. 0.70


FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod and Allison Jewel
regarding status for return of rental fleet cars;
continuing meeting with Jay Lander on the telephone. 0.90


FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding status of the
First Union leased cars. 0.30


06/19/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.70


FCC Conference call with Brian Files and Canadian diesel
vendor regarding tainted fuel received and
resolution for same; brief follow-up meeting with
Ryan Ratledge regarding same. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach regarding extension
of the U.S. and Canada liability and property
schedules. 0.30


06/23/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting via the
telephone regarding status of operations. 0.70


06/24/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.70


FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding status of the
return of the leased car for First Union and Narcat. 0.50


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod and Ryan Ratledge
regarding car hire rates for the Narcat leased cars. 0.30


FCC E-mail to Maureen Horrigan regarding status of the
car return for First Union. 0.10
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FCC Exchange e-mails with Chuck Brown regarding status


of car return for Narcat. 0.20


06/25/2014 FCC Review the draft Derby lease for insurance issues. 0.30
FCC Meeting with David Houghton regarding status of


electronic backup and review two smartphones for
redeployment to CMQ employees. 0.40


FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.70


FCC Telephone call with Tom Tancula regarding return of
Railworld's inventory and brief meeting with Ryan
Ratledge regarding same; e-mail to Tom regarding
confirmation of the process. 0.30


06/26/2014 FCC Attend the management meeting regarding status of
the operations. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach regarding insurance
requirements for MMA post-closing of the Canadian
assets. 0.40


06/27/2014 FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding insurance
renewal. 0.20


FCC Two telephone calls with Peter Bleach regarding
pending cancellation of insurance policies and
continuing coverage for Derby property and workmen's
compensation policies for contracted services to the
CMQ. 0.60


06/30/2014 FCC Attend the daily management meeting regarding status
of the operations. 0.40


FCC Separate telephone calls with Peter Bleach regarding
termination of insurance policies and issuance of
the workmen's compensation policy for Derby. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach regarding inability
to confirm issuance of workmen's compensation policy
for Derby (.2) and telephone call with Bob Keach
regarding same (.2); meeting with John Giles
regarding shutdown of Derby's operations until the
policy can be obtain (.3); follow-up conference call
with John and Ryan Ratledge regarding same (.2). 0.90


07/01/2014 FCC Meeting with Sachi Mishra regarding tanker cars from
Valero. 0.20


FCC Multiple e-mails and telephone calls with Peter
Bleach regarding issuance of workmen's compensation
policy for Derby, including responding to two
information requests regarding same. 1.20


07/02/2014 FCC Respond to information requests from Peter Bleach
regarding workmen's compensation policy for Derby. 0.20


FCC Review and respond to information requests from BSB
regarding status of locomotives subject to its lien
(.2); meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding status of
insurance for same and for units owned by RWD that
were previously insured by MMA (.2); e-mail to Tom
Tancula regarding cancellation of coverage for same
(.1). 0.50


07/03/2014 FCC Numerous telephone calls and e-mails with Peter
Bleach, Greg Jameson (MEMIC), Gaynor Ryan and Jim
Speed regarding obtaining workmen's compensation
insurance for the Derby operations by effective
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HOURS
7/7/14. 0.90


07/07/2014 FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach regarding the
workmen's compensation follow-up issues for renewal. 0.20


07/10/2014 FCC Telephone call with Pierre Legault regarding
Canadian Pacific's empty tank car issue; follow-up
e-mail to Ryan Ratledge regarding same. 0.20


07/11/2014 FCC Multiple separate e-mails and telephone calls with
Peter Bleach, Jim Speed and John Fessenden regarding
payment for workmen's compensation policy, which was
not properly processed on 7/3/14. 0.50


07/15/2014 FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding status of
monthly operating reports for May and June,
workmen's compensation insurance renewal and wind
down issues. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach regarding
cancellation of CDN auto policy and continuation of
MMA crime policy. 0.20


07/16/2014 FCC Meeting with Tom Tancula and Adam Jokisch (Adams
Auctioneer and Real Estate Co.) regarding procedures
to conduct locomotion auction on MMA property (1.0);
prepare outline of procedures for same and telephone
call with Bob Keach regarding same (.4); follow-up
meeting with Tom, Adam and Ryan Ratledge regarding
my suggested procedures outline and payment for
services provided by CMQ and MMA (.5). 1.90


FCC Follow up on additional information request from
Peter Bleach for new liability coverage for the
Derby facility and the "tie pile", meeting with Tom
Tardiff and Jerry Keller regarding same, prepare
summary of information and e-mail same to Peter
Bleach. 0.70


07/17/2014 FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding wind down
issues, including auction to be held at Derby. 0.20


FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding status of car
return for Anderson and First Union Railcar. 0.40


07/18/2014 FCC Telephone call with Maureen Horrigan regarding
status of car return for cars leased from First
Union Railcar. 0.20


07/22/2014 FCC Review letter received from MEMIC regarding working
conditions at Derby and telephone call with Ken
Strout regarding same. 0.40


FCC Multiple separate calls with Sam Anderson and Ryan
Ratledge regarding auction procedures to be held on
Derby premises. 0.60


07/23/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge regarding sale day
premise control required for expected media
attention; follow-up telephone call with Sam
Anderson regarding same, and prepare proposed
premise control procedures and e-mail same to CMQ
and BSB for follow up. 0.70


07/24/2014 FCC Telephone call with Paula Ripley regarding
termination of certain environmental permits at
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Derby. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Jerry Keller regarding question
on certain car repair invoices. 0.20


FCC Review information received from Ken Strout
regarding MEMIC's safety issues at Derby, finalize
Ken's response to MEMIC and e-mail same to Peter
Bleach. 1.10


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding status
update for auction, liability insurance renewal and
workmen's compensation issues at Derby. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Peter Bleach regarding status of
liability policy for Derby. 0.10


07/30/2014 FCC Two telephone calls with Peter Bleach regarding
workmen's compensation and Derby liability insurance
issues. 0.20


07/31/2014 FCC Continue follow up on obtaining liability insurance
for Derby, including conference call with Fortress
regarding backup plan, notification to BSB regarding
the backup plan for next week's auction and multiple
calls with Peter Bleach and his staff regarding
other carrier possibilities; receive insurance
commitment midday, complete final acceptance forms
and e-mail same to Peter Bleach. 2.50


08/01/2014 FCC Telephone call with Maureen Horrigan with First
Union Railcar regarding the lease rejection issues. 0.30


08/07/2014 FCC Make sufficient inquiries regarding historical loss
claims and execute no loss memo for liability
insurance at Derby, and e-mail same to Peter Bleach
for submission to the carrier. 0.70


FCC Prepare for (.2) and attend conference call with
David Houghton and Chris Falk regarding status of
electronic backup of all servers, workstations and
laptops (.4). 0.60


08/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with Jamie Lebar regarding additional
information required of Derby's general liability
policy and complete questionnaire. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Jerry Keller regarding certain
car repair issues. 0.20


08/11/2014 FCC Review the extended policy period information
received from Peter Bleach for both the U.S. and
Canada liability policies, telephone call with Peter
regarding same and e-mail recommendation for same to
the trustee. 0.60


08/12/2014 FCC Attend the conference call with Sam Anderson and
Patrick Maxcy regarding settlement of outstanding
issues with the railroad, including spare parts
inventory still at Derby. 0.60


FCC Multiple e-mails with Tom Tancula, Dave Baker and
Ryan Ratledge and telephone call with Dave regarding
identification of Railworld's inventory at Derby and
arrange for shipment of same. 0.50


08/14/2014 FCC Follow up on status of returned leased cars,
including meeting with Jerry Keller regarding status
of new lease negotiations with former lessors and
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CMQ and meeting with Alison Jewel regarding
obtaining yard reports for location of units; update
analysis and e-mail to Jerry and Bob Grindrod for
review. 1.30


08/20/2014 FCC Telephone call with John Giles regarding status of
empty oil tankers (.3); follow-up e-mail to George
Marcus and Alec Jarvis (Wheeling) regarding same
(.1); e-mail back to John Giles regarding resolution
of issue (.1). 0.50


FCC Review information received from Peter Bleach
regarding workman's compensation insurance policy
for Derby location, telephone call with Peter
regarding same, and e-mail Alan Darrah response
required by MEMIC. 0.50


08/21/2014 FCC Telephone call with Greg Dursk (First Union Railcar)
regarding repair invoices for the returned cars. 0.20


08/27/2014 FCC Telephone call with Jeff Salisbury, representative
for the insurance company for Derby, regarding
inspection of same; follow-up telephone calls with
David Baker and Jeff regarding coordination of same. 0.30


09/03/2014 FCC Telephone call with Bob Grindrod regarding
information request received from the Canadian TSB
regarding status of locomotive Unit #5017; follow-up
e-mail to Bob Keach regarding same. 0.30


09/11/2014 FCC Conference call with Chris Falk and David Houghton
regarding status of electronic backup issues and
continuing the meeting with David regarding separate
backup of MMA's "W" Drive. 0.50


09/18/2014 FCC Telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding the Derby
insurance and VRAP issues. 0.20


09/22/2014 FCC Telephone call with Hatley Webb regarding workmen's
compensation insurance inspection for Derby and
e-mail David Baker regarding same. 0.30


09/23/2014 FCC Telephone call with Sachi Mishra regarding the lease
for the boom and grapple; follow-up conference call
with Dan Daughterly (lessor of boom and grapple) and
Sachi regarding status of lease for same. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Maureen Horrigan regarding
finalization of accounts receivable and accounts
payable issues between MMA and First Union Railcar. 0.30


09/25/2014 FCC Telephone call with Jeremy Fischer regarding status
of VRAP and insurance policies for Derby. 0.20


09/30/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge regarding status
of VRAP for Derby and potential requirement for a
Phase II study (.2); follow-up telephone call with
Bob Keach regarding same (.2). 0.40


Managing Business Operations 86.80 55,118.00


05/01/2014 FCC Review and e-mail comments for the draft transition
services agreement (.2) and telephone call with Sam
Anderson regarding same and other closing issues
(.4). 0.60
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HOURS
FCC Conference call with Gaynor Ryan, Bob Grindrod and


Don Gardner regarding status of transition issues,
including Human Resource issues, funding mechanism
if a bifurcated closing occurs, the Derby services
agreement and the need for continuing insurance for
same and status of other transition issues. 1.00


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding funding
mechanism for a bifurcated closing and other
transition and closing issues. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Don Gardner regarding cash
management system issues during the transition. 0.30


FCC Update the cash forecast for the current week's
activity and continue analysis for funding mechanism
for MCC in the event of a bifurcated closing; e-mail
same to Bob Keach for review. 1.80


FCC Meeting with Ken Nicholson regarding the transition
services agreement, Derby service agreement and
funding mechanism for MCC in the event of a
bifurcated closing. 1.50


FCC Review the revised third amendment to the asset
purchase agreement, transition services agreement
and Derby services agreement, and e-mail Bob Keach
with my comments. 1.20


05/02/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Bob Keach, Sam Anderson
and representatives of CDN Monitor regarding closing
and allocation issues (.8); continuing call Bob and
Sam regarding same (.2). 1.00


FCC Attend conference call with Bob Keach, Sam Anderson
and counsel for Fortress regarding closing issues. 1.30


05/05/2014 FCC Review the revised shop services agreement for Derby
for business issues. 0.20


FCC Attend the conference call with Bob Keach, Sam
Anderson and counsel for Fortress regarding closing
documents. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Tom Tardiff regarding
environmental issue at Derby and e-mail Bob Keach
regarding same. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding allocation
issues between the two countries. 0.20


05/06/2014 FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding operational
issues in the event a bifurcated closing occurs. 0.90


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding allocation
issues for the sale. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach regarding the revised
closing statement and allocation issues. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Andrew Adessky regarding the
draft closing statement and country allocation
issues. 0.40


FCC At the request of Bob Keach, review supporting
documentation for various negotiation strategies to
resolve country allocation issues. 2.30


MEF Review Intralinks' statement; e-mail D. Gardner and
J. Fessenden regarding same. 0.10


05/07/2014 FCC Compose correspondence to Bob Grindrod and the Board
of Directors of MCC regarding status of funding for
MCC after closing of MMA (U.S. side). 0.30


FCC Review and respond to multiple e-mails from Bob
Keach and Sam Anderson regarding closing issues. 0.50


Case 13-10670    Doc 1168-1    Filed 10/24/14    Entered 10/24/14 13:54:30    Desc
 Exhibit A    Page 29 of 62







Page: 29
Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/08/2014


 
 


HOURS
FCC Review the cure schedule and e-mail to Tom Tardif


regarding same. 0.40


05/08/2014 FCC Meeting with Bob Keach and Sam Anderson regarding
closing issues, including proration between U.S. and
Canada and payment of all administrative expenses. 1.50


05/09/2014 FCC Meeting with Tom Tardif regarding the revised
contract schedule. 0.60


FCC Attend conference call with Bob Keach and Matthew
Troy (with FRA) regarding questions on closing
statement. 0.40


FCC Meeting with Bob Grindrod regarding coordination for
the management of MCC in the likely event of a
bifurcated closing of the U.S. and Canadian track. 0.80


FCC Review the revised closing schedules and exhibits,
including contracts assumed, employee Exhibit 3.1
and prepayments and deposits; update the draft
closing statement and e-mail same to the trustee and
buyer representatives. 1.50


FCC Meeting with David Houghton regarding schedule of
computer hardware and software password exhibit,
brief telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding
same and fax schedule to Sam. 0.60


05/12/2014 FCC Continue to review and edit draft schedules for U.S.
closing. 1.20


FCC Review comments from Fortress regarding the draft
closing schedules and supporting exhibits for same,
revise U.S. real estate tax allocation revised by
Tom Tardif, and e-mail documents to the trustee and
Fortress' counsel. 1.50


FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson and Kyle Johnston
regarding the draft closing schedule and answer
their questions on the transition services
agreement. 0.50


05/13/2014 FCC Review the allocation schedule and the prepay
deposit finalized schedules; telephone call with Sam
Anderson regarding same and closing mechanics. 0.70


05/14/2014 FCC Review and approve revised severance agreements for
five employees. 0.30


FCC Review Schedules 3.8B and 3.7, including separate
meetings with Tom Tardif, Gaynor Ryan, Don Gardner
and Bob Grindrod regarding same. 1.30


FCC Meeting with Tom Tardif regarding review of real
estate tax proration and plan to call all
muncipalities for pay off amounts. 0.60


FCC Continue preparation for closing, including multiple
calls with Sam Anderson, Bob Keach and Kyle Johnston
regarding closing statement issues, revision of same
and finalization of open points on schedules and
exhibits for the closing statement. 2.50


05/15/2014 FCC Attend the conference call with Ken Nicholson and
Kyle Johnston regarding status of the MMA health
insurance policy, run off of claims for same and
401(k) plan. 0.50


FCC Attend conference call with Tom Iacona and Kyle
Johnston regarding closing statement review. 0.70


FCC Continue responding to the sale closing information
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requests regarding revisions of supporting schedules
and closing statement and questions on same,
including numerous telephone calls with Sam Anderson
regarding same. 2.80


05/16/2014 FCC Meeting with Kim Thompson regarding preparation of
final real estate tax payment schedule and
verification of amount with each municipality,
including meeting with Tom Tardif regarding two
townships, review and approve her work product. 1.50


FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach and Sam Anderson
regarding closing mechanics for the remaining sale
proceeds. 0.20


05/20/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson regarding status
of post-closing allocation issues, transition issues
and status of the operations at LMS. 0.40


FCC Review the schedule of utilities requiring transfer
to CMQ and meeting with Tom Tardif regarding same,
including issues related to the power purchase
contract with Liberty Electric. 0.70


MEF Exchange e-mails with and leave voicemail for R.
LaMantia regarding status of data room, send e-mails
to F. Caruso regarding same, and have data room hard
drive sent to K. Johnston of Fortress. 0.30


06/11/2014 FCC Review and update the Real Estate tax proration
schedule for Canadian property in anticipation of
sale closing. 1.20


06/13/2014 FCC Telephone call with Don Regan regarding interest in
the Derby property. 0.10


06/17/2014 FCC Review and comment on extension request for Canadian
closing and additional accounts receivable factoring
facility. 0.20


06/19/2014 FCC Telephone call with Gaynor Ryan and Marc Goddard
(Growlings) regarding accrued vacation and benefit
schedule for the Canadian employees, timing of
payment for same and status of real estate tax
schedule. 0.50


06/20/2014 FCC Review vacation and benefit accrual schedule
prepared by Gaynor Ryan (.3) and telephone call with
Gaynor regarding same and preparation for closing
Canada (.2). 0.50


06/23/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Bob Keach, Sam Anderson,
Jeff Stein, Terry Hynes and Canadian counsel
regarding status of Canadian closing issues. 0.90


06/24/2014 FCC Begin preparation of draft closing statement for
Canada sale planned for 6/30/14, including analysis
of real estate tax proration schedule prepared by
Growlings and review of employee accrued vacation
schedule prepared by Gaynor Ryan and calculate
employer's payroll taxes payable upon same; e-mail
analysis to Sam Anderson for his review. 1.70


06/25/2014 FCC Telephone call with Pierre Legault regarding closing
issues. 0.30
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FCC Telephone call with Bob Grindrod and Bob Keach


regarding closing issues for Canada. 0.30
FCC Attend conference call with Bob Keach, Jeff Stein,


Terry Hynes and Canadian counsel for the trustee and
Fortress regarding closing issues for Canada. 0.70


FCC Review real estate tax schedule received from Alain
Labonde (.4); telephone call with Alain regarding
same and status of analysis for school taxes (.2). 0.60


FCC Prepare the updated closing statement for sale of
Canada, including meeting with Gaynor Ryan and Jim
Speed regarding calculation of employees liabilities
to be assumed by Fortress and update credits to the
buyer; e-mail same to the trustee, Fortress and
applicable counsel. 1.50


FCC Telephone call with Kyle Johnston regarding
questions on the closing statement. 0.30


06/26/2014 FCC Review the updated municipal and school tax
schedules received from Growlings, municipal tax
schedule converted by Richter into an Excel file,
telephone call with Alain Labonde regarding same and
distribute to all parties. 1.50


FCC Meeting with Tom Iacona and Sachi Mishra regarding
closing statement questions. 0.40


FCC Address allocation issues for Canadian closing
raised by Growlings, including telephone calls with
Alain Labonde and Sam Anderson, review of
preliminary reports prepared by KPMG for Fortress,
prepare comparison of various drafts and e-mail same
to the trustee. 1.50


FCC Research and respond to inquiries from Growlings
regarding updates to various schedules for Canadian
closing. 0.70


06/27/2014 FCC Telephone call with Bob Keach and Canadian counsel
regarding open points for closing. 0.50


FCC Multiple calls with Alain Labonde and Bob Keach
regarding asset allocation issues per KPMG's draft
valuation report. 0.60


FCC Multiple updates and review of draft closing
schedule and e-mails to counsel for CMQ and trustee
regarding same. 1.50


FCC E-mail to Bob Keach and Canadian counsel regarding
disclosure of Stanbridge subdivision issue. 0.30


MEF Review Intralinks' invoice; e-mail to J. Fessenden
to have paid. 0.10


06/30/2014 FCC Review motor vehicle registration issue for closing
and telephone call with Alain Labonde regarding
same. 0.30


FCC Review final closing statement for Canada closing
and telephone call with Tom Iacona regarding
exchange rate issue; review redraft and e-mail Bob
Keach regarding final approval. 0.80


FCC Authorize $75,000 wire transfer for the Canada
environmental issue (.1) and monitor e-mails
regarding confirmation of funds between buyer,
Monitor and the trustee; provide proof of wire
transfer made by MMA to fund environmental issue
(.4). 0.30


MEF E-mail R. LaMantia with instructions to shut down
the MMA data room. 0.10
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07/02/2014 FCC Review and revise the real estate tax payment
schedule for Canadian municipal and school taxes,
including telephone call with Alain Labonde
regarding coordination with filing deeds and meeting
with Sachi Mishra regarding same. 1.90


07/07/2014 FCC Telephone call with Shawn Travitsky regarding
payment of vacation wages for Canadian employees not
rehired by CMQ. 0.10


07/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with Sachi Mishra regarding status of
payments to Canadian municipalities and request to
be paid on MCC's account, and e-mail Bob Keach for
approval of same. 0.30


07/10/2014 FCC Review summary of real estate taxes paid by MCC and
$701,000 reimbursement received from CMQ for same. 0.20


07/14/2014 FCC Meeting with Tom Tardiff regarding status of
transfer of utility accounts to CMQ for Canadian
accounts. 0.20


07/16/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson regarding status
of VRAP for Derby facility. 0.20


FCC Review tax notice received from State of Vermont for
unpaid transfer taxes, telephone call with Mary
Woods at Vermont Department of Revenue regarding
same, and follow up with Sam Anderson to obtain copy
of cancel check from Bernstein's trust account. 0.40


07/22/2014 FCC E-mail VT tax notice regarding unpaid transfer taxes
to Carl Lisman and telephone call with Carl
regarding resolution for same; e-mail Sam Anderson
regarding status. 0.40


07/29/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Sam Anderson, Michael
Hahn, Rob Burgess, David Baker (CMQ) regarding
auction procedures for the locomotives. 0.90


07/30/2014 FCC Telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding recent
response from Michael Hahn regarding auction
procedures and e-mail Michael my response for same. 0.20


08/04/2014 FCC E-mail Ryan Ratledge regarding rate request for the
auction; follow-up telephone call with Sam Anderson
regarding same. 0.30


08/05/2014 FCC At Derby to supervise the auction of 25 locomotives
formerly owned by MMA, including telephone calls
with Ryan Ratledge and John Giles regarding
locomotive alleged tow rates to Northern Maine
Junction and St. Jean; telephone call with Sam
Anderson regarding outcome of the auction and
potential tow rate dispute; meeting with David Baker
regarding supervision of the site post-sale. 3.00


08/06/2014 FCC Prepare the auction summary by unit and e-mail same
to Bob Keach (.5); meeting with Ryan Ratledge
regarding status of haulage rates to Northern Maine
Junction and St. Jean (.2). 0.70
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08/12/2014 FCC Telephone call with Dave Baker and Ryan Ratledge


regarding discovery of vandalism involving the
recently sold locomotives still stored at Derby, and
e-mail notification of same to Bob Keach, Railworld
and Bangor Savings Bank, continue notification calls
and telephone call with all four buyers of the
locomotives. 1.80


08/13/2014 FCC Continue follow up on locomotive vandalism incident
which occurred at the Derby location, including
e-mail and telephone communication notification to
owners of the units, telephone call with Robert
Grindrod and result of his on-site review and
multiple e-mails to Mike Hahn and Sam Anderson
regarding updates. 0.90


08/14/2014 FCC Continue investigation of vandalism incident at
Derby, including telephone call with Joe Pinkhan
regarding receipt of scrap at B&S Scrap Yard,
telephone call with Dennis Dyer regarding status of
investigation and police report and telephone call
with David Baker regarding inspection of units to be
scraped. 1.00


08/18/2014 FCC Telephone call with Dave Baker regarding status of
scrapping operation by B&S Recycling. 0.20


FCC Review MCC real estate tax bills received and
meeting with Tom Tardif regarding same. 0.30


08/27/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Baker regarding status of
scrapping and removal operations for the locomotives
sold at auction. 0.20


09/23/2014 FCC Separate telephone calls with George Bakeris
(purchased 14 locomotives) and Raymond Thornton
(purchased 5 locomotives) regarding status of
removal of their units from Derby; follow-up
telephone call with David Baker (CMQ) regarding
same. 0.70


09/24/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Baker regarding status of
removal of the locomotives sold at auction from the
Derby premise; follow-up call with Raymond Thornton
regarding same. 0.50


Sale of Assets 68.90 43,526.50


05/02/2014 FCC Telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding the BSB
and Midwest Railcar settlement issues. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Mike Fagone regarding the
Wheeling settlement issues. 0.40


FCC At the request of counsel, prepare analysis of the
DSI and MMA expenses incurred for the potential
506(c) claim against Wheeling and e-mail same to
Mike Fagone. 0.80


05/07/2014 FCC Meeting with Don Gardner regarding preparation for
the Wheeling collateral hearing . 0.50


FCC Review the analysis prepared by Wheeling regarding
their diminution claim, review actual payment
history for invoice paid subsequent to 10/18/13 and
other collateral report issues and multiple
telephone calls with Mike Fagone regarding same. 2.50
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05/13/2014 FCC Begin preparation of Wheeling collateral analysis
and alleged diminution regarding same, including
analysis received from George Marcus. 3.20


05/14/2014 FCC Continue analysis of Wheeling alleged diminution
claim and prepare schedule for debtor's position and
create "bridge" to analysis prepared by Wheeling
(2.2); two telephone calls with Mike Fagone
regarding same (.5). 2.70


05/19/2014 FCC Attend pre-meeting with Mike Fagone to prepare for
the settlement conference with George Marcus
regarding the Wheeling settlement (.5); continue the
meeting with Mike and George Marcus regarding
Wheeling's alleged diminution claim (1.5). 2.00


FCC Review the draft settlement motion with Bangor
Savings Bank. 0.20


05/20/2014 FCC Review the draft settlement motion with Bangor
Savings Bank and compute final rents due for
locomotive usage pursuant to the settlement (.6);
telephone call with Sam Anderson regarding same
(.2). 0.80


05/21/2014 FCC Attend the mediation with George Marcus, Bob Keach
and the judge regarding the collateral valuation
dispute with Wheeling. 2.70


06/02/2014 FCC Telephone call with Mike Fagone regarding Wheeling
collateral dispute issues. 0.30


06/06/2014 FCC Telephone call with Mike Fagone regarding results of
today's court hearing regarding the Wheeling
dispute. 0.10


06/13/2014 FCC Review the ISS cutoff issues for the Wheeling
collateral report. 0.40


06/24/2014 FCC Telephone call with George Marcus regarding return
of the CP empty tank cars and collection of
outstanding $174,000 accounts receivable. 0.20


06/25/2014 FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding consent to
conduct auction of the BSB locomotives at Derby and
e-mail confirmation to BSB and the trustee. 0.40


07/10/2014 FCC Conference call with Mike Fagone and George Marcus
regarding Exhibit A for the settlement motion with
Wheeling and answer George's questions regarding
historical write-off or adjustments to pre-10/18/13
accounts receivable collateral. 0.50


07/15/2014 FCC Meeting with Kim Thompson regarding schedule for
unsettled waybills and why previous unsettled
waybill actually paid under a differenct number;
review final information received from Kim and
prepare summary schedule for delivery to Wheeling. 1.40


07/17/2014 FCC Final compilation of WB invoices and summary for
Wheeling collateral and e-mail same to Mike Fagone
for distribution. 0.30
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FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter regarding status of copy


process for freight invoices for Wheeling. 0.10


07/23/2014 FCC Review information received from George Marcus
regarding waybill information for Exhibit A,
telephone call with Kim Thomspon regarding support
for same, telephone call with Mike Fagone regarding
same, and e-mail response with additional support to
George. 0.80


Secured Lenders/Cash Colltl. 20.60 13,081.00


05/01/2014 FCC Travel from New York, NY, to Chicago, IL (meeting
with Fortress). 3.00


05/05/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Portland, ME; flight
delay. 5.00 n/c


FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Bangor, ME. 2.20


05/07/2014 FCC At the request of counsel, travel from Hermon, ME,
to Portland, ME, to attend 5/8/14 bankruptcy
hearing. 2.20


05/08/2014 FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Hermon, ME. 2.20


05/16/2014 FCC Travel from Hermon, ME, to Portland, ME. 2.20
FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Chicago, IL. 3.50 n/c


05/18/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Portland, ME. 3.00 n/c


05/19/2014 FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Hermon, ME. 2.20


05/22/2014 FCC Travel from Hermon, ME, to Portland, ME. 2.20
FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Chicago, IL. 3.00 n/c


06/02/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Portland, ME. 3.00 n/c
FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Hermon, ME. 2.20


06/05/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL, (first day
of direct flights, will charge only driving time
between Portland and Bangor). 2.20


06/09/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL,  to Bangor, ME, via new
direct flight service. 2.20


06/13/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL. 2.20


06/16/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME. 2.20


06/20/2014 FCC Travel from Hermon, ME, to Bangor, ME (direct flight
from Bangor was cancelled). 2.20


FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Chicago, IL. 3.00 n/c


06/23/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME. 2.20


06/27/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL. 2.20


06/29/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Portland, ME. 3.30 n/c


06/30/2014 FCC Travel from Portland, ME, to Hermon, ME. 2.20


07/03/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL (limit travel
time for trip between Hermon, ME, and Portland, ME). 2.20
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07/13/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME (flight
delayed 2 hours). 2.20


07/17/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL (flight
delayed by 1 hour). 2.20


08/04/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME; incurred
4-hour flight delay. 2.20


08/05/2014 FCC Travel to/from Derby, ME, to attend the auction. 2.00


08/08/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL (flight one
hour late). 2.20


08/12/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME; flight
delayed by 3 hours. 2.20


08/15/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL. 2.20


08/18/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME, through
connection at Ronald Reagan Washington National
Airport. 2.20


08/22/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL. 2.20


08/25/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME (flight
delayed 4 hours due to storms). 2.20


08/28/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL (flight was
delayed 1 hour). 2.20


09/08/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Bangor, ME (flight one
hour late). 2.20


09/12/2014 FCC Travel from Bangor, ME, to Chicago, IL; flight 1.5
hours late. 2.20


09/30/2014 FCC Travel from Chicago, IL, to Portland, ME. 3.00 n/c
FCC Drive from Portland, ME, to Hermon, ME. 2.20


Travel at 1/2 68.80 21,844.00


05/13/2014 FCC Prepare cash requirements for CMQ for the first
three months of the operations (.8); meeting with
Sachi Mishra and Jim Speed regarding same (.3);
e-mail the draft to Kyle Johnston and telephone call
with Kyle regarding same (.3). 1.40


05/20/2014 FCC Review information request received from Tom Iacona
regarding purchase accounting issues (.3) and attend
conference call with Tom, Kyle Johnston and Sachi
Mishra regarding responses for same. (.9). 1.20


FCC Review files for sale of track to the State of Maine
and e-mail the asset purchase agreement to Tom
Iacona. 0.30


05/22/2014 FCC Attend the conference call with Tom Iacona, Sachi
Mishra and KPMG representatives regarding valuation
of intangibles involving the work force, the Union
contract and other miscellaneous topics. 1.00


05/23/2014 FCC Attend the conference call with Sachi Mishra, Tom
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Iacona and Kyle Johnston regarding audit and
financial reporting required for MMA's financials at
12/31/13 and 3/31/14. 1.00


FCC Attend the conference call with Tom Iacona, Tom
Tardif and Sachi Mishra regarding valuation issues
for the land occupation agreements. 1.00


06/05/2014 FCC Meeting with Ryan Ratledge regarding status of
railcar fleet (.8); follow-up meeting with Jay
Lander regarding same (.3). 1.10


06/06/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ryan Ratledge to prepare for
today's conference call with Narcat. 0.30


06/10/2014 FCC Attend the conference call with Jim Speed, Tom
Iacona, Sachi Mishra and Greg Sanborn regarding
historical financial reporting for MMA required by
CMQ. 1.20


06/12/2014 FCC Review of workpapers support for balance sheet
accounts as of December 2013. 1.50


FCC Meeting with Don Gardner regarding additional
closing procedures required for the December 2013
general ledger, including correction of allocation
journal entry and additional documentation for
balance sheet accounts, all necessary for the audit
required by CMQ. 1.10


06/13/2014 FCC Telephone call with Tom Iacona regarding the work
plan for historical audits. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Jim Speed and Torrie Potter regarding
the work plan for the accounting department for next
week. 0.40


06/16/2014 FCC Review workpapers analysis prepared by Tom Iacona
(.2) and attend conference call Tom Iacona, Torrie
Potter, Jim Speed, Chris Ryan and other KPMG
representatives regarding same and audit planning
(1.4). 1.60


06/17/2014 FCC Meeting with Chris Ryan and Sachi Mishra regarding
planning audits for 12/31/13 and review of
workpapers already prepared. 1.90


FCC Attend conference call with Tom Iacona, Sachi
Mishra, Chris Ryan and other representatives of KPMG
regarding reporting CMQ reporting requirements. 0.90


FCC Begin review of accounts receivable and inventory
workpapers for the 12/31/13 audit and meeting with
Torrie Potter and Brian Files regarding unreconciled
differences regarding same. 2.30


06/18/2014 FCC Prepare journal entry to record CMQ's acquisition of
MMA as of 5/15/14, including for payments made to
MMA for various expenses and e-mail to Tom Iacona
with comments for items to be discussed. 0.80


06/19/2014 FCC Prepare workpapers analysis for ISS and Waybill
liabilities outstanding, accrued U.S. and Canada
real estate taxes outstanding, accrued U.S. and
Canada health insurance claims, analysis of Wheeling
and Camden note payables, inventory reconciliation
to perpetual records, U.S. and Canada freight and
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miscellaneous, accounts receivable, both as of
12/31/13 and 3/31/14 in order to reconcile the
general ledger. 3.90


06/20/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Sachi Mishra, Tom
Iacona, Chris Ryan and other Fortress team members
regarding status of the 2013 audit and reporting
requirements (.6); continuing call with Tom Iacona
regarding same and staffing requirements (5). 1.10


06/23/2014 FCC Response to multiple e-mails from CMQ-Fortress'
accounting personnel regarding accounting questions
for 12/31/13 and 3/31/14. 0.50


06/24/2014 FCC Telephone call with Tom Iacona regarding the work
plan and status of audit for 12/31/13. 0.30


FCC Meeting with Chris Ryan and Cynthia Kielkucki of
KPMG regarding status of account reconciliations for
2013 audit, including allocation issues between the
U.S. and Canada, and attend conference call with Tom
Iacona and others at Fortress regarding same. 2.70


06/25/2014 FCC Meeting with Greg Sanborn, Sachi Mishra and Tom
Iacona regarding audit issues for 12/31/13. 1.30


06/26/2014 FCC Meeting with Sachi Mishra, Jim Speed and Torrie
Potter regarding closing issues for CMQ's May
general ledger. 0.90


FCC Meeting with Chris Ryan regarding open audit issues
for accounts receivable, accrued profession fees,
bad debt reserve and interline accounts receivable
and accounts payable issues. 1.40


06/27/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Tom Iacona, Ryan
Christopher and other Fortess and KPMG
representatives regarding audit issues. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Tom Iacona regarding financial
reporting issues at 12/31/13 and on a go forward
basis. 0.50


FCC Review net ton mile schedule and status of account
assignments for 12/31/13 and 3/31/14. 0.30


07/01/2014 FCC Prepare workpapers for the locomotive lease schedule
for the Fortress audit. 0.90


FCC Review and reconcile detailed invoice register and
accounts payable aging report for the Canada
accounts payable, generate workpapers for the
12/31/13 audit and e-mail to KPMG. 1.80


FCC Review and reconcile the discrepancies between the
detailed invoice register, accounts payable aging
and general ledger for U.S. payable, prepare
supporting workpapers for the audit and e-mail to
KPMG. 2.50


FCC Prepare for (.1) and attend telephone call with Tom
Iacona and the KPMG team to review accounting
entries required to record closing statement issues
for the Canada sale (.5). 0.60


FCC Finalize accrued lease expense for locomotives and
prepare accrued and unpaid Maine corporate income
tax workpapers and e-mail both to KPMG. 1.90


FCC Meeting with the KPMG team to review and explain
workpapers prepared by me, including the U.S. and
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Canada accounts payable, accrued Maine corporate
income taxes, locomotive lease payable and
miscellaneous open points for each; continue meeting
to discuss appropriate bad debt reserve for U.S. and
Canada freight accounts receivable, U.S. and Canada
miscellaneous accounts receivable, and due from the
accounts with LMS and Railworld. 1.50


07/02/2014 FCC Numerous 10-minute meetings with Torrie Potter and
Brenda Tarr to answer their questions regarding
preparation of the general ledger account
reconciliations. 1.00


FCC Prepare workpapers for reconciliation on unpaid
Maine railroad tax, including review of 2012 return
filed and draft return for 2013 and payments made
for 2012; e-mail same to KPMG for the audit. 1.00


FCC Finish workpapers schedule for accrued locomotive
lease expense, including research for amounts due to
Canadian Pacific that were never formally invoiced. 0.70


FCC Meeting with KPMG to review audit workpapers
completed today and status of open issues. 0.60


07/03/2014 FCC For preparation of audit and potential unrecorded
liabilities, review proofs of claim for Midwest
Railcar, Canadian National Railroad, Canadian
Pacific Railroad, Anderson Railcar, CITl and Flex
Leasing. 0.80


07/08/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Christopher Ryan and
other KPMG team members regarding questions on
account reconciliations and draft financial
statement for 12/31/13, including language and
disclosure issues for the footnotes. 1.20


FCC Review the first draft of the management
representation letter for the Fortress audit of MMA
and MCC and mark comments for discussions with Bob
Keach. 0.40


07/10/2014 FCC Review the draft of the CMQ May financial statement
and telephone call with Jim Speed regarding comments
and fuel inventory issue. 0.40


FCC Telephone call with Andrew Adessky regarding
professional fee accrual for MCC, review schedule of
professional fee and payments for Canadian
professionals and e-mail same to KPMG. 0.70


07/11/2014 FCC Telephone call with Tom Iacona regarding status of
audits for 12/31/13 and account reconciliations for
3/31/14, and my schedule for next week. 0.40


07/14/2014 FCC Meeting with Ryan Christopher and Cindy Kielkucki
regarding status of account reconciliation for
12/31/13 audit. 0.80


FCC Meeting with Chris Ryan and Cindy Kielkucki
regarding draft financial statement for 12/31/13,
including footnote disclosures. 0.70


FCC Begin my review for all 12/31/13 workpapers for the
audit and compare to prior year. 2.00


07/15/2014 FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter regarding follow-up
issues for 12/31/13 and 3/31/14 workpapers. 0.50


FCC Research and respond to questions from Sachi Mishra
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regarding capital leases and documentation for
environmental issues in Canada. 0.70


07/16/2014 FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter regarding answer to her
questions regarding workpaper reconciliations. 0.30


FCC Meeting with Brenda Tarr regarding answering her
questions regarding workpaper reconciliations. 0.30


FCC Meeting with Baker Newman auditors to review open
point issues, including reconciliation of accounts
payable, certain accrued liability accounts, payable
to CIT for locomotive usage, bad debt reserve,
accounts payable contra account, and other
miscellaneous topics. 1.40


FCC Review fixed asset workpapers to record impairment
charge based upon the KPMG valuation, and
rollforward for same to 12/31/13, 3/31/14 and
5/15/14 (1.2); brief meeting with Chris Ryan
regarding questions (.2). 1.40


07/17/2014 FCC Meeting with Baker Newman auditors regarding
accounts payable reconciliation and composition of
bad debt reserve and accounts payable contra account
for CIT and Flex Leasing, including follow up on
information request for same. 1.20


FCC Meeting with Chris Ryan regarding status of KPMG
workproduct for 12/31/13 and 3/31/14 and revised
timetable to complete. 0.30


07/18/2014 FCC Telephone call with Kyle Johnston regarding revenue
issue for June and July, status of VRAP for Derby
facility, and status of leased car return. 0.40


FCC Telephone call with Pallavi Ryan (Fortress
accountant) regarding status of audit, including
timetable for same and open issues. 0.30


07/24/2014 FCC Telephone call with Pallavia Rayan regarding her
questions regarding closing statements for both MMA
and MCC; e-mail Pallavia supporting schedules for
same. 0.70


07/30/2014 FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding status
of the 12/31/13 audit and review of 3/31/14
financials. 0.30


FCC Telephone call with Sachi Mishra regarding closing
issues for May and June; e-mail Sachi my workpapers
regarding same. 0.40


08/11/2014 FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding
inventory open point for the audit; e-mail Sachi
Mishra regarding same. 0.40


FCC Telephone call with Ms. Shin from Fortress regarding
status of open points for financial reporting and
priority schedule for same. 0.30


08/12/2014 FCC Telephone call with Torrie Potter regarding
unreconciled freight and accounts receivable
clearing account for May and review information
regarding same received from Torrie. 0.30


08/13/2014 FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed to review
status of May and June open points for CMQ
financials. 0.60


Case 13-10670    Doc 1168-1    Filed 10/24/14    Entered 10/24/14 13:54:30    Desc
 Exhibit A    Page 41 of 62







Page: 41
Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/08/2014


 
 


HOURS
FCC Conference call with Fortress' Ms. Shin, Mr.


Schneider and David Moreno regarding status of
financial reporting and priority schedule for same. 0.60


FCC Multiple telephone calls with Brian Files regarding
final adjustments for physical inventory of spare
parts as of 5/15/14, including quantity calculation
for certain "piles" of transportation rails
supplies. 1.20


FCC Reconciliation of CMQ May revenue  reporting,
including meetings with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed,
and conference call with Fortress personnel
regarding same. 3.00


FCC Review draft of management letter for 12/31/13 audit
and telephone call with Don Gardner regarding
$917,000 liability to MTQ. 0.80


08/14/2014 FCC Meeting with Brian Files regarding completion of
physical inventory at 5/15/14, review same, complete
supporting schedule for 12/31/13 audit, and e-mail
same to Melinda Irish. 0.90


FCC Review CMQ general ledger activity reports for
accrued freight, payable to other carriers, revenue
suspense account, freight revenue, and account
receivables for May and June and prepare
reconciliation of same, including multiple meetings
with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed for supporting
information and questions. 5.50


FCC Attend conference call with Fortress and Baker
Newman representatives regarding status of audit;
continuing call with Fortress regarding status of
CMQ May and June reconciliations for the freight
suspense and related accounts. 1.50


08/15/2014 FCC Finalize reconciliation of the Unsettled Waybill,
ISS settlement, freight accounts receivable and
revenue as of 5/31/14, 6/30/14 and 7/31/14. 5.00


FCC Telephone call with Fortress Financial's staff
regarding status of work plan and resolve final
issues for the management representation letter. 0.50


FCC Telephone call with Pallavi Ryan regarding
explanation of supporting workpapers for 5/31/14,
6/30/14 and 7/31/14. 0.60


08/18/2014 FCC Begin review of workpapers for 3/31/14 prepared by
KPMG and Torrie Potter, including accrued vacation
and benefits, accrued real estate taxes, deferred
credits and accounts receivable; e-mail to Ryan
Christopher regarding open points for the vacation
schedule. 1.50


08/19/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson regarding expanded
transition services agreement between CMQ and MMA;
follow-up telephone call with Bob Keach regarding
same; e-mail Ken the outline of the proposed term
sheet. 0.60


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Chris Ryan regarding
status of workpapers reconciliations for 3/31/14. 0.50


FCC Meeting with Brian Files and Sachi Mishra regarding
accounts payable cutoff and physical inventory
issues. 0.20


FCC Reconciliation of accounts as of 3/31/14, including
U.S. and Canada unsettled waybills, due foreign
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roads, accounts receivable, freight revenue, accrued
property taxes and begin reconciliation of accounts
payable. 5.00


08/20/2014 FCC Conference call with Fortress, KPMG and Baker Newman
representatives regarding status of the 3/31/14
financials and additional adjustment required for
12/31/13. 0.60


FCC Telephone call with Pallavi Ryan regarding current
status of the 3/31/14 review and staffing issues. 0.30


FCC Continue reconciliation of accounts payable, car
hire revenue and expense and various accrual
accounts. 4.00


08/21/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding status
of the 3/31/14 account reconciliations. 0.20


FCC Meeting with Torrie Porter and Chris Ryan regarding
the remaining accounts regarding reconciliations for
3/31/14. 0.50


FCC Continue reconciliations of accounts for 3/31/14,
including car hire revenue and expense, locomotive
and railcar lease expense, accrued environmental,
prepaid insurance, accrued Maine railroad tax,
accrued delayed invoices and review account
reconciliations prepared by others, including
accounts receivable and accrued payroll and
vacation. 6.80


08/22/2014 FCC Review draft audit report for 2013. 0.70


08/26/2014 FCC Attend morning meeting with Pallavi Rayon, Jim
Speed, Torrie Potter and Sachi Mishra regarding
accounting procedures for the monthly financial
statement closings. 3.50


FCC Continue meeting with Pallavi Rayon, Jim Speed,
Torrie Potter and Sachi Mishra regarding accounting
procedures for CMQ. 3.60


08/27/2014 FCC Meeting with Pallavi Rayon regarding final comments
to footnotes for 2013 audit and staffing issues for
the accounting department. 0.90


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Pallavi Rayon
regarding accounting procedures for accrued
liabilities. 0.50


FCC Research questions received from Chris Ryan
regarding 3/31/14 quarterly review and telephone
call with Chris regarding same. 0.70


FCC Begin review of the CMQ and CMC July financial
statements, including the initial recording of
purchase transactions for treatment of liabilities
assumed. 4.00


08/28/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Greg Sanborn and
other Fortress representatives regarding revisions
to footnote disclosures and management
representation letter. 0.30


FCC Continue review of CMQ and CMC July financial
transactions, including reconciliation of all
accrual accounts and opening journal entries,
including multiple telephone calls with Pallavi
Rayon and meetings with Sachi Mishra, Torrie Potter
and Jim Speed. 8.50
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08/29/2014 FCC Complete workpapers analysis for accrued employee
benefits for CMQ and CMC, including telephone call
with Gaynor Ryan regarding benefits paid to Canadian
former employees, review of payroll register for
same and status of Canadian pension payments. 0.80


FCC Conference call with Fortress regarding LMS
guarantee. 0.30


09/02/2014 FCC Conference call with Fortress regarding footnote
disclosures for 2013 audit and draft footnote for
the LMA guarantee and e-mail same to David
Schneider. 0.60


FCC Continue review of the CMQ and CMC July financials,
including reconciliation of health claims, certain
prepays and employee benefit accruals; follow-up
e-mails to Sachi Mishra and Torrie Potter regarding
same. 1.50


09/03/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding the
LMS footnote disclosure for the 2013 audit and draft
and e-mail footnote for same; review the revised
footnote received from David and two follow-up calls
regarding same. 0.60


09/04/2014 FCC Respond to information request from Sachi Mishra
regarding the rolling stock asset schedules. 0.10


09/05/2014 FCC Multiple telephone calls with David Schneider
regarding finalization of footnotes for the 2013
audit report. 0.50


09/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider and Yunyoung
Shin regarding final footnote issues for the 2013
audit. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding final
standard review questions prior to issuing report
for the 2013 audit. 0.40


FCC Final review of the draft 2013 audit report and send
final comments regarding footnotes to Melinda Irish. 0.90


09/09/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Sachi Mishra and
Torrie Potter regarding currency exchange issues for
CMQ accounting software. 0.50


FCC Attend conference call with Greg Sanborn, Pallavi
Rayon, David Schneider and Melinda Irish regarding
final report issues (.5); review and execute the
final draft of management representation letter
(.2). 0.70


FCC Begin review of 3/31/14 MMA and MCC financials,
including multiple meetings with Torrie Potter and
telephone calls with Melinda Irish regarding same. 3.50


09/10/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, David Schneider
and Sachi Mishra regarding status of the CMQ July
financial statements. 0.70


FCC Assist Sachi Mishra and Torrie Potter in review of
CMQ July activity, account reconciliations and
preparation of financial statements, and two
telephone calls with Sachi, Kyle Johnston, Pallavi
Rayon and David Schneider regarding same. 2.50


FCC Continue review of the 3/31/14 MMA financial
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HOURS
statements and review the draft report prepared by
Baker Newman. 2.70


09/11/2014 FCC Complete review of the 3/31/14 MMA financials,
including review and comment on David Schneider's
suggested changes and questions on the financial
footnotes. 1.50


FCC Begin review of MMA's general ledger for unposted
adjusted journal entries by KPMG and Baker Newman
auditors and prepare the draft analysis for same. 1.30


FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding my
comments to draft review report for 3/31/14. 0.20


FCC Begin review of August CMQ financials, including
preparations of WB and ISS payables. 0.80


09/15/2014 FCC Continue review of the CMQ August financial
statements, including conference call with Torrie
Potter and Jim Speed regarding the accrued waybills
and due to foreign carriers. 3.00


FCC Review the revised financial statement and footnotes
for 3/31/14 and telephone call with Pallavi Rayon
regarding locomotive lease expense and other
miscellaneous topics. 1.00


09/16/2014 FCC Continue review and reconciliation of CMQ general
ledger for 8/31/14, including multiple conference
calls with Jim Speed and Torrie Potter regarding
unsettled waybills and telephone call with Pallavi
Rayon regarding status. 2.80


09/17/2014 FCC Continue review and preparation of the CMQ 8/31/14
general ledger and financial statements, including
completion of reconciliation of unsettled waybills,
prepare workpapers and template for accrued Maine
railroad tax, telephone call with Pallavi Rayon
regarding accrued health insurance claims and review
accruals for miscellaneous revenue accounts. 4.00


09/18/2014 FCC Reconcile the MMA's and MCC's journal entries on
KPMG's workpapers and reconcile to the general
ledger for posting of same. 2.00


09/22/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding his
information request for MCC's estimated net income
for April 2014 - June 2014. 0.20


FCC Review the draft comparative balance sheet and
operating statement for CMQ May 2014 through August
2014 and telephone call with Jim Speed regarding
comments and questions. 0.70


09/23/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Kyle
Johnston and Sachi Mishra regarding planning for
September's CMQ financial statement closing (.6);
follow-up call with Sachi regarding same (.1). 0.70


09/24/2014 FCC Review the adjusted journal entries for legal
expense push down provided by Pallavi Rayon and
telephone call with Sachi Mishra and Pallavi
regarding recording of same. 0.40


09/25/2014 FCC Conference call with Jim Speed, Torrie Potter and
David Schneider regarding the draft profit and loss
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HOURS
for the three months ended 6/30/14 required by
Fortress by close of business at 10/26/14. 0.50


FCC Complete reconciliation of journal entries for
12/31/13 and 3/31/14 and e-mail analysis to Chris
Ryan for follow up. 2.80


09/26/2014 FCC Review the general ledger activity reports for MMA
for April 2014, May 2014 and June 2014, and posting
of the adjusted journal entries for 3/31/14,
reconcile major accounts and prepare draft profit
and loss statement for the three months ended
6/30/14. 7.20


09/29/2014 FCC Review and respond to e-mail from Pallavi Rayon
regarding accrued property taxes as of 8/31/14. 0.20


Transition Services 171.10 108,648.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 604.90 344,375.00


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 68.80 $317.50 $21,844.00
F. C. Caruso 486.80 635.00 309,118.00
M. E. Farnsworth 45.90 260.00 11,934.00
E. R. Sweitzer 3.40 435.00 1,479.00


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 344,375.00


BALANCE DUE $344,375.00
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MONTREAL, MAINE & ATLANTIC CORPORATION
SUMMARY OF EXPENSES  FROM 5/1/14 TO 9/30/14


AIRFARE SEE ATTACHED SCHEDULE 15,846.88
LODGING SEE ATTACHED SCHEDULE 6,231.80
MEALS SEE ATTACHED SCHEDULE 1,888.24
RENTAL CAR SEE ATTACHED SCHEDULE 3,336.15
PARKING, ETC. SEE ATTACHED SCHEDULE 2,451.53
LONG DISTANCE PHONE 155.01
PHOTOCOPY CHARGE (852   @ .15) 127.80
MISC SUPPLIES(HARD DRIVE) 120.00
OVERNIGHT DELIVERY 40.03


30,197.44
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MONTRAL, MAINE & ATLANTIC CORPORATION
SUMMARY OF TRAVEL EXPENSES 
5/1/14 to 9/30/14


DESTINATION ORIGINATING RENTAL PARKING,
FROM TO NAME LOCATION LOCATION NIGHTS AIRFARE LODGING MEALS CAR ETC. TOTAL


5/5/14 5/8/14 F. CARUSO BANGOR, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 361.78 409.51 129.89 42.76 943.94
5/8/14 5/16/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 8 538.78 960.42 206.38 548.16 474.48 2,728.22


5/18/14 5/22/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 4 1,092.56 523.83 119.95 275.31 213.71 2,225.36
6/2/14 06/05/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 1,275.56 337.11 93.80 217.54 154.88 2,078.89
6/9/14 06/13/14 F. CARUSO BANGOR, ME CHICAGO, IL 4 1,137.56 451.73 156.84 236.33 135.00 2,117.46


6/16/14 6/20/14 F. CARUSO BANGOR, ME CHICAGO, IL 4 1,262.56 557.43 133.88 273.65 187.50 2,415.02
6/23/14 6/26/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 1,417.56 337.11 97.57 208.17 157.30 2,217.71
6/29/14 7/2/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 1,317.56 407.26 115.27 206.93 166.90 2,213.92
7/13/14 7/17/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 4 1,174.78 449.48 175.26 273.65 178.15 2,251.32
8/4/14 8/7/14 F. CARUSO BANGOR, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 1,176.98 337.11 110.34 205.69 78.25 1,908.37


8/12/14 8/15/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 1,346.98 337.11 113.45 205.69 139.35 2,142.58
8/18/14 8/22/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 4 1,480.26 449.48 165.88 273.65 205.00 2,574.27
8/25/14 8/28/14 F. CARUSO PORTLAND, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 1,136.98 337.11 140.44 205.69 157.00 1,977.22


09/08/14 09/11/14 F. CARUSO BANGOR, ME CHICAGO, IL 3 1,126.98 337.11 129.29 205.69 161.25 1,960.32
15,846.88 6,231.80 1,888.24 3,336.15 2,451.53 29,754.60
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No. 10715


REMIT TO:


Telephone: 312.263.4141 Telecopier: 312.263.1180


Date: 09/10/14


CMQ Railway
c/o Pallavi Rayon


F.E.I.N. 36-2967476


Fees Disbursements Credits Balance
Hours Rate


For services for week of August 15, 2014:
  Transition Services 21.20       635.00         $13,462.00
  *Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40         317.50         $1,397.00


For services for week of August 22, 2014:
  Transition Services 20.90       635.00         $13,271.50
  *Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40         317.50         $1,397.00


For services for week of August 29, 2014:
  Transition Services 23.10       635.00         $14,668.50
  *Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40         317.50         $1,397.00


Total Fees $45,593.00


Travel & Admin Costs: 8/15/2014 8/22/2014 8/29/2014
  Airfare 1,346.98   1,480.26   1,136.98      $3,964.22
  Lodging 337.11      449.48      337.11         1,123.70
  Meals 113.45      165.88      140.44         419.77
  Car Rental 205.69      273.65      205.69         685.03
  Parking/Tolls/Cabs/Mileage 139.35      205.00      157.00         501.35
  Photocopies 17.70           17.70
  Long Distance Calls 16.56       16.56


2,142.58   2,590.83   1,994.92      $6,728.33


$52,321.33
* Total travel time is limited to 2.2 hours per flight, which represents the 
drive time between Portland & Bangor, regardless of the actual flight time
between Chicago and Bangor (ie., no charge for flight delays). 


PAY LAST AMOUNT
IN THIS COLUMN


Three First National Plaza     70 West Madison Street, Suite 2300, Chicago, IL 60602-4250


Description of Services and Disbursements


TIMELY PAYMENT OF INVOICES IS ALWAYS APPRECIATED.


Weekly Detail
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 09/10/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
08/11/2014 FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding


inventory open point for the audit; e-mail Sachi
Mishra regarding same. 0.40 3589


FCC Telephone call with Ms. Shin from Fortress regarding
status of open points for financial reporting and
priority schedule for same. 0.30 3590


08/12/2014 FCC Telephone call with Torrie Potter regarding
unreconciled freight and accounts receivable
clearing account for May and review information
regarding same received from Torrie. 0.30 3596


08/13/2014 FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed to review
status of May and June open points for CMQ
financials. 0.60 3599


FCC Conference call with Fortress' Ms. Shin, Mr.
Schneider and David Moreno regarding status of
financial reporting and priority schedule for same. 0.60 3600


FCC Multiple telephone calls with Brian Files regarding
final adjustments for physical inventory of spare
parts as of 5/15/14, including quantity calculation
for certain "piles" of transportation rails
supplies. 1.20 3601


FCC Reconciliation of CMQ May revenue  reporting,
including meetings with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed,
and conference call with Fortress personnel
regarding same. 3.00 3602


FCC Review draft of management letter for 12/31/13 audit
and telephone call with Don Gardner regarding
$917,000 liability to MTQ. 0.80 3603


08/14/2014 FCC Meeting with Brian Files regarding completion of
physical inventory at 5/15/14, review same, complete
supporting schedule for 12/31/13 audit, and e-mail
same to Melinda Irish. 0.90 3607


FCC Review CMQ general ledger activity reports for
accrued freight, payable to other carriers, revenue
suspense account, freight revenue, and account
receivables for May and June and prepare
reconciliation of same, including multiple meetings
with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed for supporting
information and questions. 5.50 3608


FCC Attend conference call with Fortress and Baker
Newman representatives regarding status of audit;
continuing call with Fortress regarding status of
CMQ May and June reconciliations for the freight
suspense and related accounts. 1.50 3609


08/15/2014 FCC Finalize reconciliation of the Unsettled Waybill,
ISS settlement, freight accounts receivable and
revenue as of 5/31/14, 6/30/14 and 7/31/14. 5.00 3610


FCC Telephone call with Fortress Financial's staff
regarding status of work plan and resolve final
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HOURS
issues for the management representation letter. 0.50 3611


FCC Telephone call with Pallavi Ryan regarding
explanation of supporting workpapers for 5/31/14,
6/30/14 and 7/31/14. 0.60 3612


Transition Services 21.20 13,462.00


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 21.20 13,462.00


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 21.20 $635.00 $13,462.00


Lodging 337.11
Meals 113.45
Airfare 1,346.98
Car Rental 205.69
Transportation 139.35


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 08/15/2014 2,142.58


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 15,604.58


BALANCE DUE $15,604.58
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c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
08/18/2014 FCC Begin review of workpapers for 3/31/14 prepared by


KPMG and Torrie Potter, including accrued vacation
and benefits, accrued real estate taxes, deferred
credits and accounts receivable; e-mail to Ryan
Christopher regarding open points for the vacation
schedule. 1.50 3621


08/19/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson regarding expanded
transition services agreement between CMQ and MMA;
follow-up telephone call with Bob Keach regarding
same; e-mail Ken the outline of the proposed term
sheet. 0.60 3622


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Chris Ryan regarding
status of workpapers reconciliations for 3/31/14. 0.50 3623


FCC Meeting with Brian Files and Sachi Mishra regarding
accounts payable cutoff and physical inventory
issues. 0.20 3624


FCC Reconciliation of accounts as of 3/31/14, including
U.S. and Canada unsettled waybills, due foreign
roads, accounts receivable, freight revenue, accrued
property taxes and begin reconciliation of accounts
payable. 5.00 3625


08/20/2014 FCC Conference call with Fortress, KPMG and Baker Newman
representatives regarding status of the 3/31/14
financials and additional adjustment required for
12/31/13. 0.60 3632


FCC Telephone call with Pallavi Ryan regarding current
status of the 3/31/14 review and staffing issues. 0.30 3633


FCC Continue reconciliation of accounts payable, car
hire revenue and expense and various accrual
accounts. 4.00 3634


08/21/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding status
of the 3/31/14 account reconciliations. 0.20 3635


FCC Meeting with Torrie Porter and Chris Ryan regarding
the remaining accounts regarding reconciliations for
3/31/14. 0.50 3636


FCC Continue reconciliations of accounts for 3/31/14,
including car hire revenue and expense, locomotive
and railcar lease expense, accrued environmental,
prepaid insurance, accrued Maine railroad tax,
accrued delayed invoices and review account
reconciliations prepared by others, including
accounts receivable and accrued payroll and
vacation. 6.80 3637


08/22/2014 FCC Review draft audit report for 2013. 0.70 3642


Transition Services 20.90 13,271.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 20.90 13,271.50
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RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 20.90 $635.00 $13,271.50


Lodging 449.48
Meals 165.88
Airfare 1,480.26
Car Rental 273.65
Transportation 205.00
Long Distance Telephone 16.56


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 08/22/2014 2,590.83


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 15,862.33


BALANCE DUE $15,862.33
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Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
08/26/2014 FCC Attend morning meeting with Pallavi Rayon, Jim


Speed, Torrie Potter and Sachi Mishra regarding
accounting procedures for the monthly financial
statement closings. 3.50 3647


FCC Continue meeting with Pallavi Rayon, Jim Speed,
Torrie Potter and Sachi Mishra regarding accounting
procedures for CMQ. 3.60 3648


08/27/2014 FCC Meeting with Pallavi Rayon regarding final comments
to footnotes for 2013 audit and staffing issues for
the accounting department. 0.90 3653


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Pallavi Rayon
regarding accounting procedures for accrued
liabilities. 0.50 3654


FCC Research questions received from Chris Ryan
regarding 3/31/14 quarterly review and telephone
call with Chris regarding same. 0.70 3655


FCC Begin review of the CMQ and CMC July financial
statements, including the initial recording of
purchase transactions for treatment of liabilities
assumed. 4.00 3656


08/28/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Greg Sanborn and
other Fortress representatives regarding revisions
to footnote disclosures and management
representation letter. 0.30 3657


FCC Continue review of CMQ and CMC July financial
transactions, including reconciliation of all
accrual accounts and opening journal entries,
including multiple telephone calls with Pallavi
Rayon and meetings with Sachi Mishra, Torrie Potter
and Jim Speed. 8.50 3658


08/29/2014 FCC Complete workpapers analysis for accrued employee
benefits for CMQ and CMC, including telephone call
with Gaynor Ryan regarding benefits paid to Canadian
former employees, review of payroll register for
same and status of Canadian pension payments. 0.80 3660


FCC Conference call with Fortress regarding LMS
guarantee. 0.30 3661


Transition Services 23.10 14,668.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 23.10 14,668.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 23.10 $635.00 $14,668.50


Photocopy Charges 17.70
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Lodging 337.11
Meals 140.44
Airfare 1,136.98
Car Rental 205.69
Transportation 157.00


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 08/29/2014 1,994.92


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 16,663.42


BALANCE DUE $16,663.42
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No. 10748


REMIT TO:


Telephone: 312.263.4141 Telecopier: 312.263.1180


Date: 10/03/14


CMQ Railway
c/o Pallavi Rayon


NOTE:  Please make check payable to Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway


F.E.I.N. 36-2967476


Fees Disbursements Credits Balance
Hours Rate


For services for week of September 05, 2014:
  Transition Services 3.30 635.00 $2,095.50


For services for week of September 12, 2014:
  Transition Services 15.90 635.00 $10,096.50
  * Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40 317.50 $1,397.00


For services for week of September 19, 2014:
  Transition Services 12.80 635.00 $8,128.00


For services for week of September 26, 2014:
  Transition Services 12.50 635.00 $7,937.50


For services for partial week of September 30, 2014:
  Transition Services 0.20 635.00 $127.00
  * Travel between Chicago & Bangor 2.20 317.50 $698.50
Total Fees $30,480.00


9/5/2014 9/12/2014 9/19/2014 9/26/2014 9/30/2014


  Airfare 1,126.98 $1,126.98
  Lodging 337.11 337.11
  Meals 129.29 129.29
  Car Rental 205.69 205.69


161.25 161.25
  Photocopies 51.90 51.90
  Long Distance Calls 1.35 1.35


1,960.32 1.35 51.90 $2,013.57


$32,493.57
* Total travel time is limited to 2.2 hours per flight, which represents the
drive time between Portland & Bangor, regardless of the actual flight time
between Chicago and Bangor (ie., no charge for flight delays).


PAY LAST AMOUNT
IN THIS COLUMN


Three First National Plaza     70 West Madison Street, Suite 2300, Chicago, IL 60602-4250


Description of Services and Disbursements


TIMELY PAYMENT OF INVOICES IS ALWAYS APPRECIATED.


Weekly Detail


Travel/Adm Costs:


  Parking/Tolls/Cabs/Mileage
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HOURS
09/02/2014 FCC Conference call with Fortress regarding footnote


disclosures for 2013 audit and draft footnote for
the LMA guarantee and e-mail same to David
Schneider. 0.60


FCC Continue review of the CMQ and CMC July financials,
including reconciliation of health claims, certain
prepays and employee benefit accruals; follow-up
e-mails to Sachi Mishra and Torrie Potter regarding
same. 1.50


09/03/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding the
LMS footnote disclosure for the 2013 audit and draft
and e-mail footnote for same; review the revised
footnote received from David and two follow-up calls
regarding same. 0.60


09/04/2014 FCC Respond to information request from Sachi Mishra
regarding the rolling stock asset schedules. 0.10


09/05/2014 FCC Multiple telephone calls with David Schneider
regarding finalization of footnotes for the 2013
audit report. 0.50


Transition Services 3.30 2,095.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 3.30 2,095.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 3.30 $635.00 $2,095.50


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 2,095.50


BALANCE DUE $2,095.50
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HOURS
09/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider and Yunyoung


Shin regarding final footnote issues for the 2013
audit. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding final
standard review questions prior to issuing report
for the 2013 audit. 0.40


FCC Final review of the draft 2013 audit report and send
final comments regarding footnotes to Melinda Irish. 0.90


09/09/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Sachi Mishra and
Torrie Potter regarding currency exchange issues for
CMQ accounting software. 0.50


FCC Attend conference call with Greg Sanborn, Pallavi
Rayon, David Schneider and Melinda Irish regarding
final report issues (.5); review and execute the
final draft of management representation letter
(.2). 0.70


FCC Begin review of 3/31/14 MMA and MCC financials,
including multiple meetings with Torrie Potter and
telephone calls with Melinda Irish regarding same. 3.50


09/10/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, David Schneider
and Sachi Mishra regarding status of the CMQ July
financial statements. 0.70


FCC Assist Sachi Mishra and Torrie Potter in review of
CMQ July activity, account reconciliations and
preparation of financial statements, and two
telephone calls with Sachi, Kyle Johnston, Pallavi
Rayon and David Schneider regarding same. 2.50


FCC Continue review of the 3/31/14 MMA financial
statements and review the draft report prepared by
Baker Newman. 2.70


09/11/2014 FCC Complete review of the 3/31/14 MMA financials,
including review and comment on David Schneider's
suggested changes and questions on the financial
footnotes. 1.50


FCC Begin review of MMA's general ledger for unposted
adjusted journal entries by KPMG and Baker Newman
auditors and prepare the draft analysis for same. 1.30


FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding my
comments to draft review report for 3/31/14. 0.20


FCC Begin review of August CMQ financials, including
preparations of WB and ISS payables. 0.80


Transition Services 15.90 10,096.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 15.90 10,096.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 15.90 $635.00 $10,096.50
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Lodging 337.11
Meals 129.29
Airfare 1,126.98
Car Rental 205.69
Transportation 161.25


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 09/12/2014 1,960.32


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 12,056.82


BALANCE DUE $12,056.82
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HOURS
09/15/2014 FCC Continue review of the CMQ August financial


statements, including conference call with Torrie
Potter and Jim Speed regarding the accrued waybills
and due to foreign carriers. 3.00


FCC Review the revised financial statement and footnotes
for 3/31/14 and telephone call with Pallavi Rayon
regarding locomotive lease expense and other
miscellaneous topics. 1.00


09/16/2014 FCC Continue review and reconciliation of CMQ general
ledger for 8/31/14, including multiple conference
calls with Jim Speed and Torrie Potter regarding
unsettled waybills and telephone call with Pallavi
Rayon regarding status. 2.80


09/17/2014 FCC Continue review and preparation of the CMQ 8/31/14
general ledger and financial statements, including
completion of reconciliation of unsettled waybills,
prepare workpapers and template for accrued Maine
railroad tax, telephone call with Pallavi Rayon
regarding accrued health insurance claims and review
accruals for miscellaneous revenue accounts. 4.00


09/18/2014 FCC Reconcile the MMA's and MCC's journal entries on
KPMG's workpapers and reconcile to the general
ledger for posting of same. 2.00


Transition Services 12.80 8,128.00


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 12.80 8,128.00


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 12.80 $635.00 $8,128.00


Long Distance Telephone 1.35


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 09/19/2014 1.35


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 8,129.35


BALANCE DUE $8,129.35
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/03/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
09/22/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding his


information request for MCC's estimated net income
for April 2014 - June 2014. 0.20


FCC Review the draft comparative balance sheet and
operating statement for CMQ May 2014 through August
2014 and telephone call with Jim Speed regarding
comments and questions. 0.70


09/23/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Kyle
Johnston and Sachi Mishra regarding planning for
September's CMQ financial statement closing (.6);
follow-up call with Sachi regarding same (.1). 0.70


09/24/2014 FCC Review the adjusted journal entries for legal
expense push down provided by Pallavi Rayon and
telephone call with Sachi Mishra and Pallavi
regarding recording of same. 0.40


09/25/2014 FCC Conference call with Jim Speed, Torrie Potter and
David Schneider regarding the draft profit and loss
for the three months ended 6/30/14 required by
Fortress by close of business at 10/26/14. 0.50


FCC Complete reconciliation of journal entries for
12/31/13 and 3/31/14 and e-mail analysis to Chris
Ryan for follow up. 2.80


09/26/2014 FCC Review the general ledger activity reports for MMA
for April 2014, May 2014 and June 2014, and posting
of the adjusted journal entries for 3/31/14,
reconcile major accounts and prepare draft profit
and loss statement for the three months ended
6/30/14. 7.20


Transition Services 12.50 7,937.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 12.50 7,937.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 12.50 $635.00 $7,937.50


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 7,937.50


BALANCE DUE $7,937.50
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/03/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
09/29/2014 FCC Review and respond to e-mail from Pallavi Rayon


regarding accrued property taxes as of 8/31/14. 0.20


Transition Services 0.20 127.00


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 0.20 127.00


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 0.20 $635.00 $127.00


Photocopy Charges 51.90


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 09/30/2014 51.90


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 178.90


BALANCE DUE $178.90
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Development Specialists, Inc. – Professional Biographies 


 


Fred Caruso 


Fred Caruso has over thirty years of insolvency, restructuring and operational experience and 
currently is the Chief Operating Officer of DSI. His experience is concentrated on the “debtor side,” 
typically serving either as the Financial Advisor, Chief Restructuring Officer, Chief Operating 
Officer, Chief Financial Officer, or as a Chapter 11 Trustee. He has also provided expert testimony 
on accounting, forensic and valuation topics. 
 


Notable assignments include: 
 


• Chapter 11 Trustee for Qualteq, Inc., and its sixteen affiliated debtors, which resulted in a 
363 sale that paid creditors in full with a distribution to equity. 


• CRO and COO for Giordano’s Enterprises, Inc.; in conjunction with its Chapter 11 Trustee, 
managed a successful 363 sale process, paid secured creditors in full, and made a significant 
distribution to creditors. 


• Financial Advisor for the real estate trust for the Gas City, Ltd. properties; in conjunction 
with the CRO for Gas City, managed a successful 363 sale process which was awarded the 
TMA Consumer and Retail Products Turnaround Award. 


• Financial Advisor for Mid-American Agri Products, a 40 million gallon ethanol facility; 
managed a successful sale process. 


• Financial Advisor for Bill Heard Enterprises, which operated 14 urban big-box Chevrolet 
locations with sales in excess of $2 billion; managed a successful 363 sale process less than 
60 days after the Lehman collapse brought the automotive industry to a standstill. 


• President and Debtor in Possession for Ritchie Risk-Linked Strategies Trading, Ltd.; 
managed a successful 363 sale process for 1,100 life insurance policies with a insured 
value of $2.8 billion. 


• Financial Advisor for a $3 billion hedge fund to manage negotiations with “gated” investors 
and monetize illiquid investments. 


• Financial advisor and expert witness to the fee examiner for Collins & Aikman Corporation. 
• Financial Advisor for Oasis Corporation; completed a going concern “article 9” sale. 
• Financial Advisor for Outboard Marine Corporation; coordinated the shutdown and sale 


of its 10 engine and boat manufacturing locations. 
• CRO for BREED Technologies, Inc.; confirmed a standalone Chapter 11 plan. 
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• President and Debtor in Possession for Commercial Financial Services, Inc., the 
country’s largest acquirer of charged-off credit card debt; negotiated a consensual 
liquidating plan between asset-backed security holders and general unsecured creditors. 


• COO for Mercury Finance Company; confirmed a standalone Chapter 11 plan. 
• Restaurant Management Services, Inc., a 120-unit fast food restaurant chain; completed 


an out-of-court restructuring. 
• CFO for Tune-Up Masters, Inc., a 250-store automotive repair chain; confirmed a 


standalone Chapter 11 plan. 
• CFO for Shape, Inc., a manufacturer of extruder plastic components; confirmed a 


standalone Chapter 11 plan. 
 


Mr. Caruso began his career in public accounting in the audit division of a Big Eight accounting 
firm (now Deloitte & Touche). For approximately two years, he served as President for Hilco 
Appraisal Services, LLP, the country’s largest provider of inventory and machinery valuations. 
He is a Certified Public Accountant, a Certified Insolvency and Reorganization Accountant, and 
is a member of the AICPA, Illinois CPA Society, the Association of Insolvency Accountants, 
and the American Bankruptcy Institute. 
 
He is a graduate of the University of Wisconsin-Madison with Bachelor’s degrees in accounting 
and finance. 


Matt Farnsworth 


Matt Farnsworth joined the professional staff of DSI in June 2001. Since joining DSI, Mr. 
Farnsworth has been directly involved in organizing the orderly wind down and sale of 
businesses, maximizing the value of estate assets, analyzing and negotiating creditor claims and 
corresponding with creditors. He has provided support, in the areas of both operations and 
finance, to ongoing DSI engagements including Chapter 11 reorganizations, Chapter 7 
liquidations and Assignments for the Benefit of Creditors. 


Mr. Farnsworth rejoined DSI in 2009 after a two-year hiatus during which he earned his Master 
of Business Administration.  Mr. Farnsworth’s areas of expertise include operational and human 
resource management, financial analysis, budgeting and schedules, cash management, 
preferential and fraudulent transfer analysis, tangible asset valuation, and due diligence. 


Notable assignments include: 


 Financial Advisor – Qualteq, Inc., Chapter 11 Bankruptcy 


 Financial Advisor – Gryphon Investors, Due Diligence  


 Financial Advisor – HUSA Liquidating Corporation (f/k/a HearUSA, Inc.), Chapter 11 
Bankruptcy 
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 Financial Advisor – Namco Capital Group, Inc., Chapter 11 Bankruptcy 


 Financial Advisor – Hayes Lemmerz International, Chapter 11 Bankruptcy 


 Financial Advisor – Jillian’s Entertainment Holdings, Inc., Chapter 11 Bankruptcy 


 Financial Advisor – Edgewater Medical Center, Chapter 11 Bankruptcy 


 Liquidating Trust – Vineyard National Bancorp, Post-Confirmation Litigation 


 Liquidating Trust – Horizon Natural Resources, Post-Confirmation Litigation 


 Sale Agent – Green Garden Country Club 


Mr. Farnsworth is a winner of The 6th Annual Turnaround Award by the M&A Advisor for 
Middle Market Chapter 11 Reorganization of the Year for his work in HUSA Liquidating 
Corporation.  He is also a member of the Turnaround Management Association and the 
American Bankruptcy Institute. 


Mr. Farnsworth received a Master of Business Administration from Indiana University’s Kelley 
School of Business with concentrations in Finance and Accounting.  He also holds a Bachelor of 
Arts degree from Lake Forest College. 


Eric Sweitzer 


Mr. Sweitzer joined Development Specialists, Inc., in 2002. During his time at DSI, Mr. 
Sweitzer has been involved in a variety of cases assisting various constituencies both within and 
outside of formal reorganization. 


Mr. Sweitzer’s experience includes a variety of assignments in the areas of bankruptcy 
proceedings, crisis management consulting and litigation consulting. He specializes in financial 
modeling and forecasting, budgeting, crisis management and short-term cash forecasting, data 
analysis, forensic accounting and monitoring various facets of daily business operations. 


Notable assignments include: 


• Chief Financial Officer – Champion Windows, LLC, out-of-court debt restructuring 
• Chief Financial Officer – Giordano’s Pizza, Inc., Chapter 11 Sale of Business 
• Chief Financial Officer – Foss Manufacturing, Inc., Chapter 11 Sale of Business 
• Financial Advisor – Huffy Corporation, Chapter 11 Sale of Business 
• Financial Advisor – Chicago H&S Hotel Property LLC, Chapter 11 Sale of Business 
• Financial Advisor – G.I. Joe’s, Chapter 11 Liquidation 
• Financial Advisor – Computer World Solution, Inc., Liquidation 
• Financial Advisor – Knight Quartz Flooring, LLC, Led Sale Process 
• Advisor to Committee of Non-Union Retirees (1114) – Dana Corporation 
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• Advisor to Committee of Non-Union Retirees (1114) – Hayes Lemmerz 
• Forensic Accountant – Automotive Professionals, Inc., Litigation Support 
• Forensic Accountant – Equipment Acquisition Resources, Inc., Litigation Support 
• Forensic Accountant – Knight-Celotex, LLC, Litigation Support 
• Forensic Accountant – Coudert Brothers LLP, Litigation Support 


Prior to joining DSI, Mr. Sweitzer was an Audit Supervisor with Schneider Downs & Co., Inc., a 
major regional accounting firm based in Pittsburgh, where his focus was servicing 
manufacturing, automotive and benefit plan engagements. Prior to Schneider Downs, Mr. 
Sweitzer was with American Express Tax and Business Services where he worked on audit 
teams servicing manufacturing and automotive clients. 


Mr. Sweitzer received his Bachelor of Business Administration degree in Accounting from Kent 
State University. He is a Certified Public Accountant and is a member of the Ohio Society of 
Certified Public Accountants and the Association of Insolvency and Restructuring Advisors. Mr. 
Sweitzer is also a winner of M&A Advisor's 40 under 40 Award for his achievements in the 
fields of turnaround management and consulting. 
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No. 10715


REMIT TO:


Telephone: 312.263.4141 Telecopier: 312.263.1180


Date: 09/10/14


CMQ Railway
c/o Pallavi Rayon


F.E.I.N. 36-2967476


Fees Disbursements Credits Balance
Hours Rate


For services for week of August 15, 2014:
  Transition Services 21.20       635.00         $13,462.00
  *Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40         317.50         $1,397.00


For services for week of August 22, 2014:
  Transition Services 20.90       635.00         $13,271.50
  *Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40         317.50         $1,397.00


For services for week of August 29, 2014:
  Transition Services 23.10       635.00         $14,668.50
  *Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40         317.50         $1,397.00


Total Fees $45,593.00


Travel & Admin Costs: 8/15/2014 8/22/2014 8/29/2014
  Airfare 1,346.98   1,480.26   1,136.98      $3,964.22
  Lodging 337.11      449.48      337.11         1,123.70
  Meals 113.45      165.88      140.44         419.77
  Car Rental 205.69      273.65      205.69         685.03
  Parking/Tolls/Cabs/Mileage 139.35      205.00      157.00         501.35
  Photocopies 17.70           17.70
  Long Distance Calls 16.56       16.56


2,142.58   2,590.83   1,994.92      $6,728.33


$52,321.33
* Total travel time is limited to 2.2 hours per flight, which represents the 
drive time between Portland & Bangor, regardless of the actual flight time
between Chicago and Bangor (ie., no charge for flight delays). 


PAY LAST AMOUNT
IN THIS COLUMN


Three First National Plaza     70 West Madison Street, Suite 2300, Chicago, IL 60602-4250


Description of Services and Disbursements


TIMELY PAYMENT OF INVOICES IS ALWAYS APPRECIATED.


Weekly Detail
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 09/10/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
08/11/2014 FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding


inventory open point for the audit; e-mail Sachi
Mishra regarding same. 0.40 3589


FCC Telephone call with Ms. Shin from Fortress regarding
status of open points for financial reporting and
priority schedule for same. 0.30 3590


08/12/2014 FCC Telephone call with Torrie Potter regarding
unreconciled freight and accounts receivable
clearing account for May and review information
regarding same received from Torrie. 0.30 3596


08/13/2014 FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed to review
status of May and June open points for CMQ
financials. 0.60 3599


FCC Conference call with Fortress' Ms. Shin, Mr.
Schneider and David Moreno regarding status of
financial reporting and priority schedule for same. 0.60 3600


FCC Multiple telephone calls with Brian Files regarding
final adjustments for physical inventory of spare
parts as of 5/15/14, including quantity calculation
for certain "piles" of transportation rails
supplies. 1.20 3601


FCC Reconciliation of CMQ May revenue  reporting,
including meetings with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed,
and conference call with Fortress personnel
regarding same. 3.00 3602


FCC Review draft of management letter for 12/31/13 audit
and telephone call with Don Gardner regarding
$917,000 liability to MTQ. 0.80 3603


08/14/2014 FCC Meeting with Brian Files regarding completion of
physical inventory at 5/15/14, review same, complete
supporting schedule for 12/31/13 audit, and e-mail
same to Melinda Irish. 0.90 3607


FCC Review CMQ general ledger activity reports for
accrued freight, payable to other carriers, revenue
suspense account, freight revenue, and account
receivables for May and June and prepare
reconciliation of same, including multiple meetings
with Torrie Potter and Jim Speed for supporting
information and questions. 5.50 3608


FCC Attend conference call with Fortress and Baker
Newman representatives regarding status of audit;
continuing call with Fortress regarding status of
CMQ May and June reconciliations for the freight
suspense and related accounts. 1.50 3609


08/15/2014 FCC Finalize reconciliation of the Unsettled Waybill,
ISS settlement, freight accounts receivable and
revenue as of 5/31/14, 6/30/14 and 7/31/14. 5.00 3610


FCC Telephone call with Fortress Financial's staff
regarding status of work plan and resolve final
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 09/10/2014


 
 


HOURS
issues for the management representation letter. 0.50 3611


FCC Telephone call with Pallavi Ryan regarding
explanation of supporting workpapers for 5/31/14,
6/30/14 and 7/31/14. 0.60 3612


Transition Services 21.20 13,462.00


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 21.20 13,462.00


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 21.20 $635.00 $13,462.00


Lodging 337.11
Meals 113.45
Airfare 1,346.98
Car Rental 205.69
Transportation 139.35


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 08/15/2014 2,142.58


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 15,604.58


BALANCE DUE $15,604.58
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 09/10/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
08/18/2014 FCC Begin review of workpapers for 3/31/14 prepared by


KPMG and Torrie Potter, including accrued vacation
and benefits, accrued real estate taxes, deferred
credits and accounts receivable; e-mail to Ryan
Christopher regarding open points for the vacation
schedule. 1.50 3621


08/19/2014 FCC Telephone call with Ken Nicholson regarding expanded
transition services agreement between CMQ and MMA;
follow-up telephone call with Bob Keach regarding
same; e-mail Ken the outline of the proposed term
sheet. 0.60 3622


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Chris Ryan regarding
status of workpapers reconciliations for 3/31/14. 0.50 3623


FCC Meeting with Brian Files and Sachi Mishra regarding
accounts payable cutoff and physical inventory
issues. 0.20 3624


FCC Reconciliation of accounts as of 3/31/14, including
U.S. and Canada unsettled waybills, due foreign
roads, accounts receivable, freight revenue, accrued
property taxes and begin reconciliation of accounts
payable. 5.00 3625


08/20/2014 FCC Conference call with Fortress, KPMG and Baker Newman
representatives regarding status of the 3/31/14
financials and additional adjustment required for
12/31/13. 0.60 3632


FCC Telephone call with Pallavi Ryan regarding current
status of the 3/31/14 review and staffing issues. 0.30 3633


FCC Continue reconciliation of accounts payable, car
hire revenue and expense and various accrual
accounts. 4.00 3634


08/21/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding status
of the 3/31/14 account reconciliations. 0.20 3635


FCC Meeting with Torrie Porter and Chris Ryan regarding
the remaining accounts regarding reconciliations for
3/31/14. 0.50 3636


FCC Continue reconciliations of accounts for 3/31/14,
including car hire revenue and expense, locomotive
and railcar lease expense, accrued environmental,
prepaid insurance, accrued Maine railroad tax,
accrued delayed invoices and review account
reconciliations prepared by others, including
accounts receivable and accrued payroll and
vacation. 6.80 3637


08/22/2014 FCC Review draft audit report for 2013. 0.70 3642


Transition Services 20.90 13,271.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 20.90 13,271.50
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 09/10/2014


 
 


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 20.90 $635.00 $13,271.50


Lodging 449.48
Meals 165.88
Airfare 1,480.26
Car Rental 273.65
Transportation 205.00
Long Distance Telephone 16.56


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 08/22/2014 2,590.83


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 15,862.33


BALANCE DUE $15,862.33
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 09/10/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
08/26/2014 FCC Attend morning meeting with Pallavi Rayon, Jim


Speed, Torrie Potter and Sachi Mishra regarding
accounting procedures for the monthly financial
statement closings. 3.50 3647


FCC Continue meeting with Pallavi Rayon, Jim Speed,
Torrie Potter and Sachi Mishra regarding accounting
procedures for CMQ. 3.60 3648


08/27/2014 FCC Meeting with Pallavi Rayon regarding final comments
to footnotes for 2013 audit and staffing issues for
the accounting department. 0.90 3653


FCC Meeting with Torrie Potter and Pallavi Rayon
regarding accounting procedures for accrued
liabilities. 0.50 3654


FCC Research questions received from Chris Ryan
regarding 3/31/14 quarterly review and telephone
call with Chris regarding same. 0.70 3655


FCC Begin review of the CMQ and CMC July financial
statements, including the initial recording of
purchase transactions for treatment of liabilities
assumed. 4.00 3656


08/28/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Greg Sanborn and
other Fortress representatives regarding revisions
to footnote disclosures and management
representation letter. 0.30 3657


FCC Continue review of CMQ and CMC July financial
transactions, including reconciliation of all
accrual accounts and opening journal entries,
including multiple telephone calls with Pallavi
Rayon and meetings with Sachi Mishra, Torrie Potter
and Jim Speed. 8.50 3658


08/29/2014 FCC Complete workpapers analysis for accrued employee
benefits for CMQ and CMC, including telephone call
with Gaynor Ryan regarding benefits paid to Canadian
former employees, review of payroll register for
same and status of Canadian pension payments. 0.80 3660


FCC Conference call with Fortress regarding LMS
guarantee. 0.30 3661


Transition Services 23.10 14,668.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 23.10 14,668.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 23.10 $635.00 $14,668.50


Photocopy Charges 17.70
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 09/10/2014


 
 


Lodging 337.11
Meals 140.44
Airfare 1,136.98
Car Rental 205.69
Transportation 157.00


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 08/29/2014 1,994.92


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 16,663.42


BALANCE DUE $16,663.42
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No. 10748


REMIT TO:


Telephone: 312.263.4141 Telecopier: 312.263.1180


Date: 10/03/14


CMQ Railway
c/o Pallavi Rayon


NOTE:  Please make check payable to Montreal Maine & Atlantic Railway


F.E.I.N. 36-2967476


Fees Disbursements Credits Balance
Hours Rate


For services for week of September 05, 2014:
  Transition Services 3.30 635.00 $2,095.50


For services for week of September 12, 2014:
  Transition Services 15.90 635.00 $10,096.50
  * Travel-Round trip between Chicago & Bangor 4.40 317.50 $1,397.00


For services for week of September 19, 2014:
  Transition Services 12.80 635.00 $8,128.00


For services for week of September 26, 2014:
  Transition Services 12.50 635.00 $7,937.50


For services for partial week of September 30, 2014:
  Transition Services 0.20 635.00 $127.00
  * Travel between Chicago & Bangor 2.20 317.50 $698.50
Total Fees $30,480.00


9/5/2014 9/12/2014 9/19/2014 9/26/2014 9/30/2014


  Airfare 1,126.98 $1,126.98
  Lodging 337.11 337.11
  Meals 129.29 129.29
  Car Rental 205.69 205.69


161.25 161.25
  Photocopies 51.90 51.90
  Long Distance Calls 1.35 1.35


1,960.32 1.35 51.90 $2,013.57


$32,493.57
* Total travel time is limited to 2.2 hours per flight, which represents the
drive time between Portland & Bangor, regardless of the actual flight time
between Chicago and Bangor (ie., no charge for flight delays).


PAY LAST AMOUNT
IN THIS COLUMN


Three First National Plaza     70 West Madison Street, Suite 2300, Chicago, IL 60602-4250


Description of Services and Disbursements


TIMELY PAYMENT OF INVOICES IS ALWAYS APPRECIATED.


Weekly Detail


Travel/Adm Costs:


  Parking/Tolls/Cabs/Mileage
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/03/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
09/02/2014 FCC Conference call with Fortress regarding footnote


disclosures for 2013 audit and draft footnote for
the LMA guarantee and e-mail same to David
Schneider. 0.60


FCC Continue review of the CMQ and CMC July financials,
including reconciliation of health claims, certain
prepays and employee benefit accruals; follow-up
e-mails to Sachi Mishra and Torrie Potter regarding
same. 1.50


09/03/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding the
LMS footnote disclosure for the 2013 audit and draft
and e-mail footnote for same; review the revised
footnote received from David and two follow-up calls
regarding same. 0.60


09/04/2014 FCC Respond to information request from Sachi Mishra
regarding the rolling stock asset schedules. 0.10


09/05/2014 FCC Multiple telephone calls with David Schneider
regarding finalization of footnotes for the 2013
audit report. 0.50


Transition Services 3.30 2,095.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 3.30 2,095.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 3.30 $635.00 $2,095.50


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 2,095.50


BALANCE DUE $2,095.50
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Montreal, Maine & Atlantic Corporation 10/03/2014
c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
09/08/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider and Yunyoung


Shin regarding final footnote issues for the 2013
audit. 0.20


FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding final
standard review questions prior to issuing report
for the 2013 audit. 0.40


FCC Final review of the draft 2013 audit report and send
final comments regarding footnotes to Melinda Irish. 0.90


09/09/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Sachi Mishra and
Torrie Potter regarding currency exchange issues for
CMQ accounting software. 0.50


FCC Attend conference call with Greg Sanborn, Pallavi
Rayon, David Schneider and Melinda Irish regarding
final report issues (.5); review and execute the
final draft of management representation letter
(.2). 0.70


FCC Begin review of 3/31/14 MMA and MCC financials,
including multiple meetings with Torrie Potter and
telephone calls with Melinda Irish regarding same. 3.50


09/10/2014 FCC Conference call with Pallavi Rayon, David Schneider
and Sachi Mishra regarding status of the CMQ July
financial statements. 0.70


FCC Assist Sachi Mishra and Torrie Potter in review of
CMQ July activity, account reconciliations and
preparation of financial statements, and two
telephone calls with Sachi, Kyle Johnston, Pallavi
Rayon and David Schneider regarding same. 2.50


FCC Continue review of the 3/31/14 MMA financial
statements and review the draft report prepared by
Baker Newman. 2.70


09/11/2014 FCC Complete review of the 3/31/14 MMA financials,
including review and comment on David Schneider's
suggested changes and questions on the financial
footnotes. 1.50


FCC Begin review of MMA's general ledger for unposted
adjusted journal entries by KPMG and Baker Newman
auditors and prepare the draft analysis for same. 1.30


FCC Telephone call with Melinda Irish regarding my
comments to draft review report for 3/31/14. 0.20


FCC Begin review of August CMQ financials, including
preparations of WB and ISS payables. 0.80


Transition Services 15.90 10,096.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 15.90 10,096.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 15.90 $635.00 $10,096.50
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Lodging 337.11
Meals 129.29
Airfare 1,126.98
Car Rental 205.69
Transportation 161.25


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 09/12/2014 1,960.32


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 12,056.82


BALANCE DUE $12,056.82
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c/o Robert J. Keach
Bernstein Shur Sawyer & Nelson
100 Middle Street
Portland  ME  04104


 
 


HOURS
09/15/2014 FCC Continue review of the CMQ August financial


statements, including conference call with Torrie
Potter and Jim Speed regarding the accrued waybills
and due to foreign carriers. 3.00


FCC Review the revised financial statement and footnotes
for 3/31/14 and telephone call with Pallavi Rayon
regarding locomotive lease expense and other
miscellaneous topics. 1.00


09/16/2014 FCC Continue review and reconciliation of CMQ general
ledger for 8/31/14, including multiple conference
calls with Jim Speed and Torrie Potter regarding
unsettled waybills and telephone call with Pallavi
Rayon regarding status. 2.80


09/17/2014 FCC Continue review and preparation of the CMQ 8/31/14
general ledger and financial statements, including
completion of reconciliation of unsettled waybills,
prepare workpapers and template for accrued Maine
railroad tax, telephone call with Pallavi Rayon
regarding accrued health insurance claims and review
accruals for miscellaneous revenue accounts. 4.00


09/18/2014 FCC Reconcile the MMA's and MCC's journal entries on
KPMG's workpapers and reconcile to the general
ledger for posting of same. 2.00


Transition Services 12.80 8,128.00


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 12.80 8,128.00


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 12.80 $635.00 $8,128.00


Long Distance Telephone 1.35


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 09/19/2014 1.35


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 8,129.35


BALANCE DUE $8,129.35
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HOURS
09/22/2014 FCC Telephone call with David Schneider regarding his


information request for MCC's estimated net income
for April 2014 - June 2014. 0.20


FCC Review the draft comparative balance sheet and
operating statement for CMQ May 2014 through August
2014 and telephone call with Jim Speed regarding
comments and questions. 0.70


09/23/2014 FCC Attend conference call with Pallavi Rayon, Kyle
Johnston and Sachi Mishra regarding planning for
September's CMQ financial statement closing (.6);
follow-up call with Sachi regarding same (.1). 0.70


09/24/2014 FCC Review the adjusted journal entries for legal
expense push down provided by Pallavi Rayon and
telephone call with Sachi Mishra and Pallavi
regarding recording of same. 0.40


09/25/2014 FCC Conference call with Jim Speed, Torrie Potter and
David Schneider regarding the draft profit and loss
for the three months ended 6/30/14 required by
Fortress by close of business at 10/26/14. 0.50


FCC Complete reconciliation of journal entries for
12/31/13 and 3/31/14 and e-mail analysis to Chris
Ryan for follow up. 2.80


09/26/2014 FCC Review the general ledger activity reports for MMA
for April 2014, May 2014 and June 2014, and posting
of the adjusted journal entries for 3/31/14,
reconcile major accounts and prepare draft profit
and loss statement for the three months ended
6/30/14. 7.20


Transition Services 12.50 7,937.50


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 12.50 7,937.50


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 12.50 $635.00 $7,937.50


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 7,937.50


BALANCE DUE $7,937.50
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HOURS
09/29/2014 FCC Review and respond to e-mail from Pallavi Rayon


regarding accrued property taxes as of 8/31/14. 0.20


Transition Services 0.20 127.00


FOR THE FOREGOING PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED: 0.20 127.00


RECAPITULATION
CONSULTANT HOURS HOURLY RATE TOTAL
F. C. Caruso 0.20 $635.00 $127.00


Photocopy Charges 51.90


TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS: THRU 09/30/2014 51.90


TOTAL CURRENT WORK 178.90


BALANCE DUE $178.90
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